25/02/2021 Gmail - Re: ORDER REF # HAE-M/17990/21

M Gma" Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>
Re: ORDER REF # HAE-M/17990/21

1 message

AlHayat Service <service@alhayatuae.com> 25 February 2021 at 13:52

To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Fares Saleh <fares.saleh@alhayatuae.com>, Tamer Qudaih <tamer.qudaih@alhayatuae.com>

Dear Sarah,

The attached proforma invoice is confirmed.
Please proceed with the order.

Thanks & Best Regards
SERVICE DEPARTMENT

AL-HAYAT PHARMACEUTICALS Tel. No :+9716 559 2481
312 Al Wahda Street, No 101 Fax. No :+9716 559 3573
P.0.Box 4483 , Sharjah , UAE Toll Free: 800 2122

Email : service@alhayatuae.com Website : www.alhayatuae.com

. . [An1S09001:2015,1S0 14001:2015, IS0 45001 :2018
OEOE Certified Company)

On Thu, Feb 25, 2021 at 1:09 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

Thank you for your email and please accept my reply.

You are on a 30 day from payment account. We send you a proforma invoice so that all details and costing can be
checked and confirmed by yourselves first. Once you have advised that you are happy with all the details, | will
proceed with the order.

If you require any further information, please let me know.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but

emails will.
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