23/02/2021 Gmail - Re: New requirement

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: New requirement

1 message

M Zaman <zaman.meditex@gmail.com> 23 February 2021 at 09:44

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate Giriffiths,

Thanks for your mail,

Pls reissue my proforma invoice, | am trying sent payment, Due to logdown in europa,
so it will be delay. This my position.

Best regards.

zaman.
23.02.2021

On Thu, Feb 18, 2021 at 7:23 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon Zaman,

| hope you are well.

Please could | advise you that the proforma invoice MVM128258 (attached) expired on February
14th. Our system requires me to delete it.

| can of course issue a new proforma invoice at any time.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the
main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we
aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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