21/02/2021 Gmail - Re: PO#1

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: PO#1

1 message

Natalia Vankova <vankova@aktimed.ru> 20 February 2021 at 06:19

To: Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Cc: sarah walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate, hi

thank you for sending the proforma.

Please change the delivery address to Manttaalitie 5B
All the rest is OK, waiting for the invoice.

Thank youl!

Best regards,
Natalia Vankova

Purchasing manager | Aktimed Plus | www.aktimed.ru |
Tel: +7.812.448.95.36 #209 | Skype: natalia_vankova |
E-mail: vankova@aktimed.ru |

Or: "Kate Griffiths" <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Komy: vankova@aktimed.ru

Konusa: "sarah walton" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>
OtnpaBneHHble: [aTHMUa, 19 ®eBpanb 2021 r 18:19:55
Tema: Re: PO#1

Good afternoon Natalia,
Thank you for your order. Please accept my reply on behalf of Sarah.

Please see attached proforma invoice. | will change it to an order once you let
me know you are happy with it and that you are happy for it be be shipped.

Please could you check the addresses and let me know of any changes you
require.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email viamed.kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Skype: viamed.kate.griffiths

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any
action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from
our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

On Fri, 19 Feb 2021 at 14:14, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Natalia Vankova <vankova@aktimed.ru>
Date: Fri, 19 Feb 2021 at 14:05

Subject: PO#1

To: sarah walton <sarah.walton@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Sarah, hi
please find PO#1 attached.
Waiting for the Invoice.

Thank you!
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Best regards,
Natalia Vankova

Purchasing manager | Aktimed Plus | www.aktimed.ru |

Tel: +7.812.448.95.36 #209 | Skype: natalia_vankova |
E-mail: vankova@aktimed.ru |
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