
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Fwd: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN128624-1 
1 message

Peter Valler <petervaller@gmail.com> 17 February 2021 at 15:23
To: info@vandagraph.co.uk

Please see mail below. 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
Fra: Peter Valler <petervaller@gmail.com> 
Date: søn. 14. feb. 2021 kl. 19.49 
Subject: Re: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN128624-1 
To: <accounts@vandagraph.co.uk> 

Hi

I just tested the R-33DE and I cannot get it to show above 18% in our Analox O2 EII. I crochecked with our other Analox
O2 EII and the cell also does not work in that one but a cell I bought from you a few years ago works fine in both.

- Peter Valler

Den ons. 3. feb. 2021 kl. 16.46 skrev <accounts@vandagraph.co.uk>: 
Please find attached invoice(s) from Vandagraph Ltd. 
 
Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.  
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk 
 
 
 
 
Regards  
Accounts Department  
Vandagraph Ltd  
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk 
 
Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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