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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: VIAMED-Cell-1372- Commandes.pdf 
1 message

Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com> 12 February 2021 at 14:34
To: Gilbert DELPECH <gilbert.delpech@wanadoo.fr>

Apologies Gilbert, it should say $34.50.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up  

Skype: viamed.sarah.walton

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in
the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Fri, 12 Feb 2021 at 14:29, Gilbert DELPECH <gilbert.delpech@wanadoo.fr> wrote: 

Yes, I’m

Please give me the price in USD, because all my invoices are in dollars

Thank you

Gilbert.

 

De : Sarah Walton [mailto:viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com]  
Envoyé : vendredi 12 février 2021 13:03 
À : Gilbert Delpech <gilbert.delpech@wanadoo.fr> 
Objet : Re: VIAMED-Cell-1372- Commandes.pdf

 

Dear Gilbert,
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Thank you for your purchase order.

 

Please be advised that the unit price for the R-17MED is €34.50.

 

I have placed your order on hold until you advise that you are happy to proceed.

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Skype: viamed.sarah.walton

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in
the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Gilbert DELPECH <gilbert.delpech@wanadoo.fr> 
Date: Fri, 12 Feb 2021 at 11:52 
Subject: VIAMED-Cell-1372- Commandes.pdf 
To: viamed-Devis prix <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

 

Bonjour Zoey,

PO for 2 cells

Deliver ASAP Please

TKS

 

Gilbert Delpech

PDG System France

Directeur Général

02 37 62 10 00

06 07 28 82 78

Gilbert.delpech@wanadoo.fr
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