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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 
1 message

COMSYS QATAR <sales@comsysqatar.com> 1 February 2021 at 10:37
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

Kindly share a PI with all the requested details.

Thanks & Regards; 

BI JI LESH  
Sales Engineer

 
Comsys Qatar
Office#:302,Retaj Building(B.#:185)
B-ring Road, Al Handza Street, P.O. Box#: 45339
t: +974 4029 9560
m: +974 5040 6926
e: sales@comsysqatar.com
 
www.comsysqatar.com             
 
 
The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third
party, without a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by
mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can
ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.

On Mon, Feb 1, 2021 at 1:34 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 
Hi Bi Ji Lesh,
 
The cost of shipping would be approximately $81.  Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing bank
charges and insurance etc.
 
Many thanks.
 
Kind regards
 
Kate Griffiths
 
Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails
will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we
can. 
 
http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
 
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
 
E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
 
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
 
 
On Mon, 1 Feb 2021 at 10:16, COMSYS QATAR <sales@comsysqatar.com> wrote: 

Dear Kate,
 
Good Morning!
 
Thank you very much for the quotation. Please find the below details of our company address.
 
Office#:302,Retaj Building(B.#:185)B-ring Road, Al Handza Street,  t: +974 4029 9560  
Hamad port, Doha, Qatar  

 
 
Thanks & Regards; 
 
BI JI LESH  
Sales Engineer

 
Comsys Qatar
Office#:302,Retaj Building(B.#:185)
B-ring Road, Al Handza Street, P.O. Box#: 45339
t: +974 4029 9560
m: +974 5040 6926
e: sales@comsysqatar.com
 
www.comsysqatar.com             
 
 
The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third
party, without a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by
mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can
ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.
 
 
 
 
On Mon, Feb 1, 2021 at 1:06 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

Good morning Bi Ji Lesh,
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Thank you for your enquiry.  The price for the R-17MED which is compatible costs $34.50 each EXW.  
 
I am unable to obtain a shipping cost without using the delivery address and post code.  Are you able to provide
that information please?
 
Many thanks. 
 
Kind regards
 
Kate Griffiths
 
Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can. 
 
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
 
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
 
E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
 
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
 
 
On Sun, 31 Jan 2021 at 18:41, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: COMSYS QATAR <sales@comsysqatar.com> 
Date: Fri, 29 Jan 2021 at 18:07 
Subject: REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk> 
 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Good Morning! 
 
Hope you are doing well, We Comsys Qatar a leading medical engineering service provider and trading
company based in Doha the capital city of Qatar. We have been in this field for the last one decade. 
 
I am writing to you today to inquire about the product  that we are interested in. Please find the below details and
kindly provide quotations of the same. 
 
1. PRECISION MEDICAL OXYGEN SENSOR WITH DIVERTER PART#: 504877- 10 EACH 
  
 
Can you please provide us with the best quote  and lead time and kindly let us know the shipping cost
to Hamad port Doha Qatar. 
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Please find the specifications as per required. 
 
 
Your reply is highly appreciated.     

 
 
Thanks & Regards; 
 
BI JI LESH  
Sales Engineer

 
Comsys Qatar
Office#:302,Retaj Building(B.#:185)
B-ring Road, Al Handza Street, P.O. Box#: 45339
t: +974 4029 9560
m: +974 5040 6926
e: sales@comsysqatar.com
 
www.comsysqatar.com             
 
 
The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third
party, without a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by
mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can
ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.
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