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Fwd: Order Kliniken Itd.

3 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Jan 27, 2021 at 2:55 PM

To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Matthias Borgert <matthias@humanmeduk.com>

Date: Wed, 27 Jan 2021 at 14:50

Subject: Order Kliniken Itd.

To: viamed Itd. <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Ladds Tom <tom@humanmeduk.com>

Hi Team viamed,

Can you please invoice this order, so that it appears in the system and give them credit terms until 30th of June 2021.
They have already paid the amount of £17,950.00 in advance.

Please deduct this amount from the total amount of the invoice.

Please do not ship the order (which is on its way) until they have paid the amount fully and the clinic is set up.

If you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact me.

Best regards,
Matthias
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Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Jan 27, 2021 at 3:14 PM

Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Matthias Borgert <matthias@humanmeduk.com>
Cc: Tom Ladds <tom@humanmeduk.com>

Hello Matthias,

| have spoken with Derek and we can invoice the proforma for you but we can not deduct from the total. | have made a
note on the proforma as per Derek to state how much has already been paid.

Would you like us to go ahead and invoice?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home,

and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take
longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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Matthias Borgert <matthias@humanmeduk.com> Wed, Jan 27, 2021 at 3:30 PM
To: Teal Zoey <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Ladds Tom <tom@humanmeduk.com>

Hi Zoey,

Thank you.

Please go ahead.

Bets regards,

Matthias
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