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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order - Oxygen Analyser 
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Jan 27, 2021 at 2:58 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Jo <Jo@medaid.co.uk> 
Date: Wed, 27 Jan 2021 at 14:54 
Subject: Order - Oxygen Analyser 
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk> 

Good afternoon,

 

I would like to place an order for 1 Teledyne Oxygen Analyser with sensor and oxygen concentrator adaptor please (a
repeat of the items in the attached invoice).

 

Please can you send the pro -forma invoice to Finance@medaid.co.uk copying me in and I will arrange for the payment to
be made. Please use ref John/OXCON.

 

If you need to contact me, my mobile number is 07938 377646. Alternatively you may call the office on 01234 930394
and speak with Tim Beacon our CEO.

 

Kind regards

 

Jo Philpot

Operations Manager
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