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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Oxygen Sensor MAX250E 
4 messages

Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> Fri, Dec 25, 2020 at 8:36 AM
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: trinhphuong2606@gmail.com

Dear Ryan,

Merry Christmas and Happy New Year!

Our customer is planning to order 150 sensor MAX250E.
Could you give us the best price for this order? 
And how long will goods be ready to ship after payment?
Thank you.
Phuong/ +84 987 546 072
An An Import Export Co., LTD

--  

An An Production Trading Import and Export company Limited.  

Add: : 497/123/14 Thong Nhat Street,  Ward 16 - Go Vap District – HCMC – Viet Nam

Phone: +84 0964136690

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Dec 29, 2020 at 11:08 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com>
Cc: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, trinhphuong2606@gmail.com

Dear Mr Khanh

Thank you very much and all the very best to your and your family.

Unfortunately the best price we can offer for the MAX-250E (part no. 0110429) is USD $69 each EXW. I am pleased to
inform you that we have them available from stock, so dispatch can be arranged upon receipt of payment.

Please let me know if you would like to proceed with a proforma invoice or if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
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Trinh Phương <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 12, 2021 at 1:37 AM
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

Our customer request Certificate of Origin. Could you make it for MAX250E?

Thank you & Best Regard,
Phuong.

Vào Th 3, 29 thg 12, 2020 lúc 18:08 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> đã viết: 
[Quoted text hidden]
--  
TRINH PHƯƠNG
ĐT: 0987 546 072 
CÔNG TY TNHH SX TM XNK AN AN
Đ/C: 497/123/14 THỐNG NHẤT, P.16, Q.GÒ VẤP, TP.HCM

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Jan 19, 2021 at 12:08 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Kate Griffitths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Please can we send them a proforma invoice, please include an EU CofO.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Trinh Phương <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> 
Date: Tue, 19 Jan 2021 at 11:07 
Subject: Re: Oxygen Sensor MAX250E 
To: Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com>, <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 

Dear Ryan,

Please send us PI with 55pcs of MAX250E. This is the first part of our contract. The rest part will be order later.
Here is our request:
- Delivery to: Ho Chi Minh City.
- Term is CIF. Pls buy insurance.
- CO, CQ is request.

We will wait your feedback.
Thank you,
Phuong

Vào Th 3, 12 thg 1, 2021 lúc 17:08 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> đã viết: 
Dear Phuong
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I have attached the declaration of conformity with the manufacturers address, will this suffice?
 
If you need a certificate of origin to accompany an order, we can apply for these from the chamber of commerce, the
cost would be approximately $75 and they are specific to an invoice/shipment.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
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