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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: New requirement 
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 13 January 2021 at 16:04
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>, Kate Griffitths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi

Please can we process this proforma invoice. He understands that there will be invoices with values accompanying the
shipment. He would like it to be sent in the same way as before, I have attached a copy of his previous invoice as a
reference.

Thank you

Ryan

Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: M Zaman <zaman.meditex@gmail.com> 
Date: Wed, 13 Jan 2021 at 09:40 
Subject: Re: New requirement 
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 

Dear Ryan Swaine.
Thanks for sending mail. As per our last price please sent proforma invoice under below quantity.

Blue =Regular =1114005 = 1000 pcs
Orange =Preemia=1114006 =200 pcs
Green =Micro = 1114007 = 1000 pcs
Delivery fm your factory of our own courier service.

A. Payment will be made USD by TT in advance fm out side of Bangladesh.
B. Dont put any price mention documents in the box of goods.

Thanks and best regards.
zaman.
13.01.2021
======================================================================

On Tue, Jan 12, 2021 at 3:52 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 
Dear Zaman
 
Please find our brochure attached. 
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We have some stock, but please let me know what you think you might need, as we are very busy with these products
at the moment?
 
I will await your reply.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
 
 
On Tue, 12 Jan 2021 at 09:44, M Zaman <zaman.meditex@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Ryan Swaine,
Thanks for your reply,  I need product Eye mask 2, Green Orange and Blue, Do you have available in your stock ?
Can you please sent me your  total product bruiser hard copy. 
Please advise. 
 
best regards.
zaman 
12.01.2021
========================================================================
 
On Mon, Jan 11, 2021 at 9:01 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

Dear Zaman
 
I am very well, thank you. I hope you are too. 
 
I have not received any other email from you recently. Please can you resend your request to me and I will address
it as soon as possible.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
 
Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
 
 
On Mon, 11 Jan 2021 at 14:17, M Zaman <zaman.meditex@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Ryan Swaine,
How are you ? We are fine here. Do you received my mail. pls reply urgently.
 
best regards.
zaman.
Meditex
Dhaka, Bangladesh.
Tel 88 02 01711 83 53 57.
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