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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Customer enquiry 
1 message

Mike <mike@thamesmedical.com> 13 January 2021 at 16:25
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate that’s perfect thank you, please find a�ached a PO

 

Kind regards

 

Mike
 

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths 
Sent: 13 January 2021 15:49 
To: Mike <mike@thamesmedical.com> 
Subject: Re: Customer enquiry

 

Good afternoon Mike,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

We have 2 x 4420505 in stock, the price is £807.50 each plus carriage, plus VAT.

 

https://twitter.com/ThamesMedical
https://www.facebook.com/Thamesmedical
http://www.linkedin.com/profile/view?id=69829705
https://www.youtube.com/user/ThamesMedicalMovies
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
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I have checked with Steve Nixon, and he has informed me that Masimo have phased that version out, but we may still be
able to get a small quantity. Going forward we will have to use their new version with an adapter cable.  If you need any
further information, I will ask Steve to clarify.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will.
Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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-----------------
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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On Wed, 13 Jan 2021 at 15:09, Mike <mike@thamesmedical.com> wrote:
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Hi Kate,

 

Do we have any availability on IRMA’s please?  I have spoken with Thameswood, they have 2 2500-M already but I
have emailed him anyway. Thank you for that,

 

Kind regards

 

Mike
 

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths 
Sent: 12 January 2021 12:03 
To: Mike <mike@thamesmedical.com> 
Subject: Customer enquiry

 

Good afternoon Mike,

 

Just a quick email to say I have referred Nicholas Hartley of Thameswood Veterinary Clinic to you just now.  He says
he may be interested in the following:

 

4410530 VM-2500-M Mainstream Capnograph (Veterinary)  

 

He contacted us through our website and only gave an email address: 

 

nick@thameswoodvets.co.uk
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I hope this is acceptable to you.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails
will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we
can.
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