
12/01/2021 Gmail - Re: Website question - Max-250E

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar6534153912042089807%7Cmsg-f%3A168867501251… 1/2

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Website question - Max-250E 
1 message

Medlux <medlux08@yahoo.com> 12 January 2021 at 10:06
Reply-To: Medlux <medlux08@yahoo.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi. My new shipping address is To : Wilfredo B. Isidro 
#17 Jachin st. Phase 3 Metrogate Complex Lambakin Marilao Bulacan Philippines 3019. 
Mobile: 09178959843. 
Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Tue, 12 Jan 2021 at 5:57 pm, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Wilfredo,

Thank you for your email.

Please see attached proforma invoice.  I have used the addresses and telephone number from your last order -
please let me know if I need to make any changes before you make payment.  I may also need to add Medlux to
the addresses.

Our paypal email address is on the proforma invoice.

I await your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as
best we can. 
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On Tue, 12 Jan 2021 at 00:49, Medlux <medlux08@yahoo.com> wrote: 
Hi. I need 1 pc of this sensor and please send it by UPS, DHL or fedex. Pleasegie also your paypal account so I
can send the payment today thanks.
 
On Monday, 12 October 2020, 06:10:58 pm GMT+8, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
 
 
Good morning Wilfredo,
 
Thank you for your enquiry via our website.
 
The price breaks for the Max-250E sensor, 0110429 are as follows:
 
$103.25 each when purchasing one
$92.93 each when purchasing two
$87.76 each when purchasing between three and ten
$82.60 each when purchasing eleven or more.
 
If you would like a proforma invoice with carriage charges etc; please let me know how many sensors you require.
 
Many thanks. 
 
Kind regards
 
Kate Griffiths
 
Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers
as best we can. 
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