M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Oxymeter
1 message

Georges Francis <info@newhorizonpharma.me> 12 January 2021 at 06:53
To: "ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan

Thank you fir clarification

Note we go now foe 1000 pcs

Can you please send us final prices CIF Beirut with delivery date
Looking forward

Best Regards

Georges

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, January 11, 2021 6:19:29 PM

To: Georges Francis <info@newhorizonpharma.me>

Subject: Re: Oxymeter

Dear Georges

| am sorry, there is nothing | can do with the pricing. | appreciate that there are cheaper models on the market, we purchased some last
year, but the quality was appalling and we returned them to the manufacturer.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 11 Jan 2021 at 15:14, Georges Francis <info@newhorizonpharma.me> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Thank you for your prompt action we want to draw your attention that we can start with 50 pcs now and within 6 months we can go to
1000 pcs
Revise your prices accordingly because they are selling the equivalent in less in our market brand China
You cannot imagine the prices that are selling
Looking forward
Best Regards
Stay safe
Georges

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, January 11, 2021 11:59:30 AM

To: Georges Francis <info@newhorizonpharma.me>

Subject: Re: Oxymeter

Hi Georges
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Thank you very much for your email.

We can offer you the MD300-C29, it is available directly from stock. We can arrange dispatch as soon as we receive payment
against a proforma invoice.

MD300-C29 - part no. 2810050 = USD $26.66 each EXW (price based on 50+)
If you are happy to proceed with an order, please let me know and | will arrange for a proforma invoice and carriage costs.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Sun, 10 Jan 2021 at 13:13, Georges Francis <info@newhorizonpharma.me> wrote:
Dear Ryan
| fwd to you this mail again because | am not sure that you have received the first mail
Sorry again to bother you

Ryan

Is too long we don't talk

Hope fines you well

Kindly note it's urgent request for oxymeter because the is a shortage in our country due the situation of Covid 19
We need as a quickly shipment for 50 pcs of

Oxymeter (China) prices CIF Beirut with delivery date sorry to bother you

Your quickly forwards highly appreciate

Best Regards

Stay safe

Georges

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Georges Francis

Sent: Sunday, January 10, 2021 3:07:53 PM

To: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: Oxymeter

Ryan

Is too long we don’t talk

Hope fines you well

Kindly note it's urgent request for oxymeter because the is a shortage in our country due the situation of Covid 19
We need as a quickly shipment for 50 pcs of

Oxymeter (China) prices CIF Beirut with delivery date sorry to bother you

Your quickly forwards highly appreciate

Best Regards

Stay safe

Georges

Get Outlook for iOS
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