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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Spare part quotation 
2 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 10 January 2021 at 19:29
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: ASH, Robert (ROYAL SURREY COUNTY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <robert.ash@nhs.net> 
Date: Sun, 10 Jan 2021 at 10:41 
Subject: Spare part quotation 
To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk> 
Cc: CALDICOTT, Ben (ROYAL SURREY COUNTY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <bencaldicott@nhs.net>,
CURNOW, Joanne (ROYAL SURREY COUNTY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <joanne.curnow2@nhs.net> 

Dear sir/madam 

 

Please provide a quote for:

 

5 x R22Vi Oxygen sensor kits

 

Please make the invoice address:

 

HEALTHCARE PARTNERS LIMITED

MA2 PAYABLES F755

PHOENIX HOUSE, TOPCLIFFE LANE

WAKEFIELD, WF3 1WE

0303 123 1177

 

And the delivery address:

 

EME Department

Royal Surrey County Hospital,

Egerton road,

Guildford

GU2 7XX
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Is there any way carriage could be waived as our trust will not pay carriage?

 

Many thanks.

 

 

Many thanks.

 

 

Robert Ash | Senior Engineer | EME Department 

Royal Surrey County Hospital | Egerton Road | Guildford | Surrey | GU2 7XX

Tel: 01483 464179 | E-mail:Robert.ash@nhs.net

 

 

 

 

************************************************************
******************************************************** 

This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient
please inform the 
sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it. 
Please do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any action
in relation to its contents. To do so is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Thank
you for your co-operation. 

NHSmail is the secure email and directory service available for all NHS staff in England
and Scotland. NHSmail is approved for exchanging patient data and other sensitive
information with NHSmail and other accredited email services. 

For more information and to find out how you can switch, https://portal.nhs.net/help/joiningnhsmail 

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 10 January 2021 at 19:44
Draft To: Robert.ash@nhs.net

Good morning Robert,

Thank you for your email.
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Please see attached quotation.  The R-22vi is available in pairs or as singles.  I have quoted for pairs as the hospital has
purchased pairs previously.  I can of course make any changes you require.

Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors.

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will.
Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can. 

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
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