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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: PCB board for UFO 130-2 O2 Sensor 
2 messages

Tjeu Souren <tjeu.souren@gmail.com> 7 January 2021 at 07:24
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Good morning Kate,

Thank you for the info.
I want to order 6 of the 0111002 UFO 130-2 PCB.

The one that you have in stock, I would like to have soonest.

Please send me an invoice for the total, and I take care of the payment.

Thank you,
Tjeu

========================= 
Tjeu Souren 
Cardiorespiratory Physiologist 
Consultant 

Schillerlaan 10 
3533 VV Utrecht - Netherlands 

E-mail: tjeu.souren@gmail.com 
Mobile: +31 651279055

Op 6 jan. 2021, om 15:04 heeft Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> het volgende geschreven:

Hi Tjeu,

Thank you for your reply.  The part number for the UFO 130-2 PCB is 0111002.  The price is €275 each
EXW.

We currently have only one in stock.

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice or if I can be of any further assistance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff
to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be
answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can. 
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On Wed, 6 Jan 2021 at 13:48, Tjeu Souren <tjeu.souren@gmail.com> wrote: 
Good afternoon Kate, thank you for taking care of course, I appreciate.
 
Sorry I was not precise enough; it is for UFO-130-2.
The type like ordered last time in December.
 
Best regards,
Tjeu
 
========================= 
Tjeu Souren 
Cardiorespiratory Physiologist 
Consultant 
 
Schillerlaan 10 
3533 VV Utrecht - Netherlands 
 
E-mail: tjeu.souren@gmail.com 
Mobile: +31 651279055
 

Op 6 jan. 2021, om 14:29 heeft Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> het volgende
geschreven:
 
Good afternoon Tjeu.
 
Thank you for your email.  Please accept my reply on behalf of Sophie.
 
Are you able to tell me if you require the PCB boards for the UFO-130 or UFO-130-2
please?  I can then ensure I give you the correct information.  Both models are mentioned
in your email.
 
I can see that your recent purchase was for the UFO-130-2, but I would like to double
check.
 
Many thanks.
 
Kind regards
 
Kate Griffiths
 
Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales
and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls
to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to
process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can. 
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On Wed, 6 Jan 2021 at 13:12, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Tjeu Souren <tjeu.souren@gmail.com> 
Date: Wed, 6 Jan 2021 at 12:53 
Subject: PCB board for UFO 130-2 O2 Sensor 
To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> 
 
 
Dear Sophie,
 
The New Year, hope all is well for you in the UK, wish you all the best.
 
I have a new request: I need some PCB boards for the UFO 130.
I only have the picture, not a part number. Can you provide me with that?
 
I would need 6
 
Thank you and best regards,
Tjeu
 
<PCB board UFO-130.jpeg>
 
 
========================= 
Tjeu Souren 
Cardiorespiratory Physiologist 
Consultant 
 
Schillerlaan 10 
3533 VV Utrecht - Netherlands 
 
E-mail: tjeu.souren@gmail.com 
Mobile: +31 651279055
 

 

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 7 January 2021 at 10:25
Draft To: Tjeu Souren <tjeu.souren@gmail.com>
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Good morning Tjeu.

It would be more expensive to part ship your order as it would involve two lots of carriage.  One lot of carriage for the first
PCB and one lot for the remaining five. 

The lead time from the date of payment received may be up to five weeks for the remaining five.

The carriage for 6 x 0111002 would be €19.55 x 2. 

I have attached the proforma invoice, please let me know if you would like any changes to be made.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will.
Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can. 
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