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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Oxygen sensor 
2 messages

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Jan 5, 2021 at 4:31 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: cathboocock27@btinternet.com

Good afternoon Cath, 

Thank you for your email. 

The price of the R-22A sensors is £46.00 each and has a carriage charge of £6.00. 

If you would like to place an order, please can you give me a full invoice and delivery address and a contact number so I
can send you a proforma.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me. 

Kind regards 

Zoey Teal

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take
longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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On Tue, Jan 5, 2021 at 4:09 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 
 
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: cathboocock27@btinternet.com <cathboocock27@btinternet.com> 
Date: Tue, 5 Jan 2021 at 15:58 
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Subject: oxygen sensor 
To: <info@viamed.co.uk> 
 
 

Hi

 

I am enquiring if you have an oxygen sensor for an Mot emissions machine? Part no R22A 0110122.

 

We are an Mot testing station, Hargreaves Mot Sandbeds Keighley.

 

Thanks

 

Phil Boocock

 

Owner

cathboocock27@btinternet.com <cathboocock27@btinternet.com> Wed, Jan 6, 2021 at 9:57 AM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Hi Zoey

Please could you go ahead and order the oxygen sensor? The full address and telephone no is

Hargreaves Mot Centre

Bradford Road

Sandbeds

Keighley

BD20 5LN

Tel no 01274 569262

We can collect as i live local? Which payment do you prefer card or Bacs transfer?

Regards

Cath Boocock
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