
21/12/2020 Gmail - RE: NEW ORDER/ VIAMED

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=97ca69e8f6&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1684234192690727019%7Cmsg-f%3A1686686821282… 1/16

Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: NEW ORDER/ VIAMED
1 message

import <import1@sielmed.ma> 21 December 2020 at 11:45
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Dear Sarah,

 

Ok good idea. You can  increase the value of the R-23V to be $46.78 per unit to cover the cost of the MAX-55E.

Thank you.

 

Cordialement / Best regards / Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Melhores Cumprimentos / Saygilarimla

 

Mme Nadia EL HATTAB

Ass�stante Trans�t & tranport

SIELMED

N° 614 et 616 Boulevard AL QODS

A�n Choc Casablanca 20153

MOROCCO

Tel  212 522 52 39 34

Tel 212 522 21 70 89

Fax 212 522 52 39 35

Email : import1@sielmed.ma

Web : www.s�elmed.com

ICE : 001459846000011

Circulaire des emballages/Pale�es en Bois Applicable au Maroc à par�r du 14/01/2019

Emballages en Bois doivent être Neufs et répondre à la Norme NIMP15 (ou ISMP15-Interna�onal Standard for Phytosanitary
Mesures)

 

Cicular of Wooden Packaging (Pallets) Applicable in Morocco from 14/01/2019 
Wood packaging must be new and meet NIMP15 (or ISMP15-Interna�onal Standard for Phytosanitary Measurement)
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De : Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] De la part de Sarah Walton 
Envoyé : lundi 21 décembre 2020 11:51 
À : import 
Objet : Re: NEW ORDER/ VIAMED

 

Dear Nadia,

 

Are you wanting the MAX-550E listing on the invoice MVM127384 (sample for evaluation) but at zero value? We can
increase the value of the R-23V to be $46.78 per unit to cover the cost of the MAX-55E and that way we have traceability
of the sensor which is required.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails
will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we
can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 21 Dec 2020 at 09:58, import <import1@sielmed.ma> wrote:

Dear Srah,

 

Ok well noted, hope receiving a posi�ve feedback.

Thank you anyway.

 

 

Cordialement / Best regards / Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Melhores Cumprimentos / Saygilarimla

 

Mme Nadia EL HATTAB

Ass�stante Trans�t & tranport

SIELMED

N° 614 et 616 Boulevard AL QODS

A�n Choc Casablanca 20153

MOROCCO

Tel  212 522 52 39 34

Tel 212 522 21 70 89

Fax 212 522 52 39 35

Email : import1@sielmed.ma

Web : www.s�elmed.com

ICE : 001459846000011

Circulaire des emballages/Pale�es en Bois Applicable au Maroc à par�r du 14/01/2019
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Emballages en Bois doivent être Neufs et répondre à la Norme NIMP15 (ou ISMP15-Interna�onal Standard for
Phytosanitary Mesures)

 

Cicular of Wooden Packaging (Pallets) Applicable in Morocco from 14/01/2019 
Wood packaging must be new and meet NIMP15 (or ISMP15-Interna�onal Standard for Phytosanitary Measurement)

 

 

De : Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] De la part de Sarah Walton 
Envoyé : lundi 21 décembre 2020 10:53 
À : import 
Objet : Re: NEW ORDER/ VIAMED

 

Good morning Nadia,

 

Apologies for the delay.  I can not make these decisions regarding your request, so I have asked our Commercial
Director if this is possible.  As soon as I have heard back, I will let you know.

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails
will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we
can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 21 Dec 2020 at 09:28, import <import1@sielmed.ma> wrote:

Reminder.

 

 

Cordialement / Best regards / Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Melhores Cumprimentos / Saygilarimla

 

Mme Nadia EL HATTAB

Ass�stante Trans�t & tranport

SIELMED

N° 614 et 616 Boulevard AL QODS

A�n Choc Casablanca 20153

MOROCCO

Tel  212 522 52 39 34

Tel 212 522 21 70 89

Fax 212 522 52 39 35

Email : import1@sielmed.ma

Web : www.s�elmed.com

ICE : 001459846000011

Circulaire des emballages/Pale�es en Bois Applicable au Maroc à par�r du 14/01/2019
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Emballages en Bois doivent être Neufs et répondre à la Norme NIMP15 (ou ISMP15-Interna�onal Standard for
Phytosanitary Mesures)

 

Cicular of Wooden Packaging (Pallets) Applicable in Morocco from 14/01/2019 
Wood packaging must be new and meet NIMP15 (or ISMP15-Interna�onal Standard for Phytosanitary Measurement)

 

 

De : import [mailto:import1@sielmed.ma]  
Envoyé : jeudi 17 décembre 2020 15:18 
À : 'sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk' 
Objet : RE: NEW ORDER/ VIAMED

 

Dear Sarah,

 

Sorry for my late reply.

Ok, we will prepare the payment in advance asap.

Since the Maxtec oxygen sensor MAX-550E  is not registered yet by our Health Ministry, we ask you pls to delete
it from the PI and to include its price by dispatching it to the others items. The total amount will be the same :
7398,50 €.   

Once you get the payment , we will pick-up the MAX-550E par�ally as a sample at our charge (invoice without
commercial value).

So, we ask you pls to revise the PI as requested to confirm and to prepare the TT payment.

Thank you.

 

 

Cordialement / Best regards / Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Melhores Cumprimentos / Saygilarimla

 

Mme Nadia EL HATTAB

Ass�stante Trans�t & tranport

SIELMED

N° 614 et 616 Boulevard AL QODS

A�n Choc Casablanca 20153

MOROCCO
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