30/11/2020 Gmail - Re: Order

M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>
Re: Order

1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 25 November 2020 at 12:56

Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: Gabriela Springlova <gabriela.springlova@divesoft.com>
Cc: Jitka Cankova <jitka.cankova@divesoft.com>, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vandagraphst.com>

Thank you Gabriela

Regards
Steve

On Wed, 25 Nov 2020 at 12:49, Gabriela Springlova <gabriela.springlova@divesoft.com> wrote:

Hello Steve,

| apologize, many e-mails, few people :-)

Yes please, try to produce 50 pcs more in January. It would be great.

And yes, change the agreed terms to a rolling contract of 200 sensors per month from February.

12/2020 150 pcs

1/2021 150 + 50 pcs maybe
2/2021 200 pcs

3/2021...... 200 pcs

Jitka will send you new order for 200 pcs per month.

Thank you very much,

Gabriela Springlova Divesoft s.r.o.

+420 416857040 Halkova 2495 | 413 01 Roudnice nad Labem | Czech Republic
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Steve Nixon
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2020 10:13 AM

To: Gabriela Springlova <gabriela.springlova@divesoft.com>

Subject: Re: Order

Hi Gabriela

I'm just checking that you received my email from yesterday?

Regards

Steve

On Tue, 24 Nov 2020 at 13:04, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> wrote:

Hi Gabriela

Ryan will get back to you regarding the surface use sensors. As far as the rebreathers sensors are concerned, we
have the following scheduled:

150 sensors - December

150 sensors - January

It is too late for December but do you want us to try and produce an extra 50 sensors in January?
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How far in advance do you want us to schedule 200 sensors, or should we change the agreed terms to a rolling
contract of 200 sensors per month?

February - 200 sensors

March ?

April ?

Regards

Steve

On Tue, 24 Nov 2020 at 12:27, Gabriela Springlova <gabriela.springlova@divesoft.com> wrote:

HEllo Ryan and Sarah,

we would like to increase the number of sensors in our framework order for both types of sensors.

We would like to receive 150 pcs of 3001 and 200 pcs of type 22 D per month.
Please, let me know if it is possible and my collegue Jitka will send new order.

Thank you in advance,

Gabriela Springlova Divesoft s.r.o.
+420 416857040 Halkova 2495 | 413 01 Roudnice nad Labem | Czech Republic
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