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M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Price and delivery time

2 messages

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Dec 16, 2020 at 9:23 AM

Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: paula.nobre@autotec.pt

Dear Paula,

Thank you for your email.

The price for 25 x 0110122 is €24.30 exw. .

The lead time would be approximately 2-4 weeks from the date of payment being received.
If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take
longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, Dec 15, 2020 at 5:31 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <paula.nobre@autotec.pt>
Date: Tue, 15 Dec 2020 at 17:27
Subject: atual price and delivery time
To: <info@viamed.co.uk>
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Dear Mr. Ryan Swaine,

Hope everyone is in good health.
The last price list | have is the one attached, probably not already in force.

Can you please inform price, delivery time and shipping costs for 25 units of the following item:

Part number 0110122
Product name R-22A Oxygen Sensor

GTIN / EAN13 5051826008607

Await your reply.
Thank you

Melhores cumprimentos,
Best Regards,

Saludos Cordiales,

Paula Nobre

(Dept. Comercial)
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AUTOTEC

Av? Leite de Vasconcelos n° 3 e 5
Alfragide Norte

2610-100 Amadora - Portugal
Tel. 00 351214727300

Fax: 00 351 21 472 73 09
paula.nobre@autotec.pt

www.autotec.pt

paula.nobre@autotec.pt <paula.nobre@autotec.pt> Wed, Dec 16, 2020 at 10:04 AM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Dear Zoey,

Thank you very much for your reply.

Please inform your cheaper transport cost to deliver the goods to our address below:

Autotec, Lda.

Av?® Leite de Vasconcelos n° 3 e 5
Alfragide Norte

2610-100 Amadora - Portugal

Note: On the other hand please inform the dimensions and weight of the volume so that |

know here also the price of transport to compare with yours

Await for your comments

Thank you and have a nice day

Melhores cumprimentos,

Best Regards,
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Saludos Cordiales,

Paula Nobre

(Dept. Comercial)

[Quoted text hidden]
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