10/12/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Delivery time R17A

M Gma || Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: Delivery time R17A

Whitted, Jason <Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com> Thu, Dec 10, 2020 at 7:19 AM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Good Morning Zoey,
Could you please adjust the invoice address and put in the one in my signature?
The delivery address is correct.

Thank you.

Viele GrufRe / Best Regards

Jason Whitted
Einkauf/Purchasing

Phone: +49 (7940) 981 88 — 1047

Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com

wouws

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH
Schliffenstralle 22

D-74653 Kinzelsau-Gaisbach
https://www.wow-portal.com

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH, Sitz in Klinzelsau, Handelsgericht Stuttgart - HRB 738 283, Ust.-ID.-Nr.: DE815330604,
Geschéftsfihrer: Frank Bartsch, Frank Konietzke, Mario Weil3

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=77e4056450&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1685674905458433559&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f%3A1685... 1/7
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Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Zoey Teal
Gesendet: Dienstag, 8. Dezember 2020 17:36

An: Whitted, Jason <Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com>

Betreff: Re: Delivery time R17A

Dear Jason,

Further to your discussion with Ryan, please find your proforma attached.

We currently do have stock of the R-17A but payment would need to be received to secure the stock.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take
longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, Dec 8, 2020 at 1:49 PM Whitted, Jason <Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com> wrote:

Hell Ryan,

Our VAT is DE815330604.

Viele GrifRe / Best Regards

Jason Whitted

Einkauf/Purchasing

Phone: +49 (7940) 981 88 — 1047

Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH
Schliffenstralle 22

D-74653 Kinzelsau-Gaisbach
https://www.wow-portal.com

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH, Sitz in Kiinzelsau, Handelsgericht Stuttgart - HRB 738 283, Ust.-ID.-Nr.: DE815330604,
Geschéftsfiihrer: Frank Bartsch, Frank Konietzke, Mario Weil3

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Dienstag, 8. Dezember 2020 14:48
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An: Whitted, Jason <Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com>
Cc: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>; Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>
Betreff: Re: Delivery time R17A

Dear Jason

Thank you very much.

One of my colleagues will be in contact with a proforma invoice, we will aim to dispatch as soon as payment is
received.

Please can you send us a copy of your company VAT number?

I look forward to your reply.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 8 Dec 2020 at 13:32, Whitted, Jason <Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan,

Thank you for the quotation.

Please find attached our purchase order. Can you send them out as soon as possible? Just for my clarification,
those are the oxygen sensor with the following connector. We need the R17A.
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Viele GriulRe / Best Regards
Jason Whitted
Einkauf/Purchasing

Phone: +49 (7940) 981 88 — 1047

Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH
Schliffenstralle 22

D-74653 Kiinzelsau-Gaisbach
https://www.wow-portal.com

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH, Sitz in Klinzelsau, Handelsgericht Stuttgart - HRB 738 283, Ust.-ID.-Nr.: DE815330604,
Geschéftsflihrer: Frank Bartsch, Frank Konietzke, Mario Weil3

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Dienstag, 8. Dezember 2020 13:32

An: Whitted, Jason <Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com>

Betreff: Re: Delivery time R17A
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Hi Jason

Thank you very much for your email. | apologise for the late reply, as | was away from my desk yesterday.

We have approximately 140x available from stock, unfortunately the price has increased since our last
conversation:

R-17A - 0110127 = EUR €27.40 each EXW (price based on orders of 100+)

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 7 Dec 2020 at 07:59, Whitted, Jason <Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com> wrote:

Godo Morning Ryan,

Could you give me your current delivery time and price for the Teledyne R17A. Do you have some in stock?

WE need 100 or 200 pcs.

Thank you in advance.

Viele Griul3e / Best Regards

Jason Whitted
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Einkauf/Purchasing

Phone: +49 (7940) 981 88 — 1047

Jason.Whitted@wow-portal.com

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH
Schliffenstralie 22

D-74653 Kinzelsau-Gaisbach
https://www.wow-portal.com

WOW! Wiirth Online World GmbH, Sitz in Klinzelsau, Handelsgericht Stuttgart - HRB 738 283, Ust.-ID.-Nr.:
DE815330604, Geschéftsfiihrer: Frank Bartsch, Frank Konietzke, Mario Weil3
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