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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

mlinke Poland - new order - 09 XII 2020 
1 message

mlinke www.mlinke.eu <sklep@mariuszlinke.pl> 9 December 2020 at 12:10
To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello Gail ;)  
At beginning I send you big smile ;)  

I would like to make new order:  
- sensor R-17 - 10 pcs  
- sensor R-22 - 1 pcs  
- sensor R-33 - 1 pcs  

Please send me invoice to payment.  

Best regards,  
mlinke ;)  

www.mlinke.eu 

sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount 
tel. +0048 793 540 230

  
Wystaw opinię o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinię!

Pomyśl o środowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomości jeśli nie jest to konieczne.

Ta wiadomość e-mail jest wolna od wirusów i złośliwego oprogramowania,  
ponieważ ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

ESET NOD32

Otrzymana wiadomość jest poufna i stanowi tajemnicę przedsiębiorstwa. Nie wolno jej ujawniać osobom trzecim. 
This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents may not be disclosed to third parties.

14 września 2020 10:27 Gail Bell <office@viamed.co.uk> napisał(a):

Good afternoon Mlinke,

We are starting to receive small but weekly deliveries so we are working through our backorders.

Looking at your account.  We have part shipped the 10 x R-17vans for you as they became available.

The 3 x R-33DE and the 1 x R-22VAN are still on backorder but we will ship these as soon as they become
available.

http://www.mlinke.eu/
http://www.mlinke.com.pl/contact-us
https://www.facebook.com/pages/mlinke-sidemount/819034414828063
https://www.google.pl/search?source=hp&ei=T7F-W-LhFJKkwAKaz554&q=MLINKE&oq=MLINKE&gs_l=psy-ab.3..0j0i10k1l9.1067.1833.0.1961.6.6.0.0.0.0.114.616.3j3.6.0....0...1c.1.64.psy-ab..0.6.615....0.1F_12oPRrg0#lrd=0x4704a1e64021a67b:0x88685820b0f8ff9e,1,,,
http://www.eset.pl/
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk


09/12/2020 Gmail - mlinke Poland - new order - 09 XII 2020

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=154df70736&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1685602499794584377&simpl=msg-f%3A16856024997… 2/3

Sorry for any confusion, please bear with us.

Kind regards

Gail Bell
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/  
Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk  
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900
-----------------

On Thu, 10 Sep 2020 at 12:04, mlinke www.mlinke.eu < sklep@mariuszlinke.pl> wrote:  

Hello Gail ;)  
Big smile for you at start ;)  

It's very good news.

I have question about proforma (no. MAN125359) and invoice (no. RAN125359-
1).  

On proforma (no. MAN125359) there are 14 pcs of sensors (R-17 - 10 pcs, R-
33DE - 3 pcs, R-22VAN - 1 pcs). Total price is 510,00 £ which I paid on 10 VIII
2020.  

On invocie (no. RAN125359-1) there are 10 pcs of sensors (only R-17 - 10 pcs).
Total price is 370 £.  

Please look at attached files. Is it your mistake?  

Best regards,  
mlinke ;)  

www.mlinke.eu 

sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount 
tel. +0048 793 540 230

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
http://www.mlinke.eu/
mailto:sklep@mariuszlinke.pl
http://www.mlinke.eu/
http://www.mlinke.com.pl/contact-us
https://www.facebook.com/pages/mlinke-sidemount/819034414828063
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Wystaw opinię o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinię!

Pomyśl o środowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomości jeśli nie jest to konieczne.

Ta wiadomość e-mail jest wolna od wirusów i złośliwego oprogramowania,  
ponieważ ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

ESET NOD32

Otrzymana wiadomość jest poufna i stanowi tajemnicę przedsiębiorstwa. Nie wolno jej
ujawniać osobom trzecim. 
This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents may not be disclosed to
third parties.

10 września 2020 09:30 Gail Bell < office@viamed.co.uk> napisał(a):

Dear Mariusz Linke,  

I am writing to inform you that your order, 10082086GB has been dispatched.  

You can track your order reference 10082086GB on the UPS website,
www.ups.com, with the following tracking number 1Z8W47826890064712.
   
Please see attached delivery note,  DAN125359-1 and a copy of your invoice,
RAN125359-1.  

Kind Regards  

Gail Bell  
Vandagraph Ltd  
gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk  

https://www.google.pl/search?source=hp&ei=T7F-W-LhFJKkwAKaz554&q=MLINKE&oq=MLINKE&gs_l=psy-ab.3..0j0i10k1l9.1067.1833.0.1961.6.6.0.0.0.0.114.616.3j3.6.0....0...1c.1.64.psy-ab..0.6.615....0.1F_12oPRrg0#lrd=0x4704a1e64021a67b:0x88685820b0f8ff9e,1,,,
http://www.eset.pl/
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.ups.com/
mailto:gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

