08/12/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Proforma Invoice for Kliniken Ltd.

M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Fwd: Proforma Invoice for Kliniken Ltd.

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Dec 8, 2020 at 4:08 PM

To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Matthias Borgert <matthias@humanmeduk.com>
Date: Tue, 8 Dec 2020 at 16:04

Subject: Proforma Invoice for Kliniken Ltd.

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <tom@humanmeduk.com>

Hi Team viamed,

Can please send me a pro forma invoice the following products:

body-jet® evo 500000-7
applicator body-jet® evo (box of 5) 57000
1suction bag (box of 24) 571871
Cann. 2.5mm 503070
I/A Cann. 3.8mm 503001

I/A Cann. 3.8mm RAPID 503002

I/A Cann. 4.2mm 503148

I/A Cann. Subcutan 503204
LipoCollector® 3+ 670000
LC Disposable Set (box of 5) 671200
Extraction Cannula 200mm (5 pcs.) 675010
L2L Conn. (box of 100) 5206634
Conn. Tubing (box of 25) 541030
Syringe Rack 610300
BEAULI™ Infitration Cann. (5 pcs.) 655020
Brush, long 102065

The whole package comes at a special price of: GBP 35.900,00
The new customer is:

Kliniken Itd.

47, Bletchley Road

Horsforth Vale

Leeds

LS18 4FG

Thank & best regards,
Matthias
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