
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: information 
1 message

francesco.r@ratio-computers.com <francesco.r@ratio-computers.com> 27 November 2020 at 12:37
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Rayan

Following the company details:

DIVE INDUSTRIES SRL 

VIA AMOROTTI 15 
58022 FOLLONICA (GR) 
c.f./p.i.: 
155124M173200

and olso the Vat number is: IT155124M173200 

N.B

The Shipping addres is:

DIVE INDUSTRIES SR

VIA VETTURINI 22/24

ZONA INDUSTRIALE VALPIANA

58024 MASSA MARITTIMA (GR)

Best Regards

Francesco 

Best Regards  

Francesco

Il 25/11/2020 13:38, Ryan Swaine ha scritto: 

Hi Francesco

Thank you very much.

Please can you provide me with your company details and VAT number if you have one and I will send you a proforma
invoice.

Best regards

Ryan 

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/VIA+AMOROTTI+15+%0D%0A++++++58022+FOLLONICA?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk


Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 25 Nov 2020 at 11:57, francesco.r@ratio-computers.com <francesco.r@ratio-computers.com> wrote: 

Hi Ryan, 

forgive my late reply but i have had problems that kept me away from work. 
In this case I would like to order 20 oxygen cells. 
To answer the question I confirm that they are not for rebrither use but are applied in an instrument that stands out of
the water.

Let me Know

Best Regards

Francesco 

Il 12/11/2020 11:53, Ryan Swaine ha scritto: 

Dear Francesco
 
Thank you very much for your email, please accept my reply on Jean's behalf.
 
I am pleased to inform you that we have the R-22VAN available from stock and the trade price is GBP
£35 each EXW.
 
Please can I check that these sensors are for surface use, as they are not suitable for use in
rebreathers?
 
Please can you provide me with your delivery/invoice address and company VAT number, so I can set
you up on our system and provide you with a proforma invoice?
 
I look forward to hearing from you.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
 
Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 
 
On Thu, 12 Nov 2020 at 09:32, francesco.r@ratio-computers.com <francesco.r@ratio-computers.com>
wrote: 

Hi Jean, 
 
I would like to order n°20pcs of oxigen sensor R-22VAN. 
 
is it possible? how much is it cost? can you send me the proforma?can  
you also tell me about the delivery time? 
 
Best regards 
 
Francesco 
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