26/11/2020 Gmail - RE: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request

1 message
Cristina Pentea <cristina.pentea@bypass.ro> 26 November 2020 at 14:59

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Bypass Office <office@bypass.ro>, Cosmina Duma <cosmina.duma@bypass.ro>

Hi Kate,
Yes, our address is

Baipas SRL
Ciheiului no 42,
410600 Oradea

Romania

Thanks!

Cristina

Cristina Pentea

Senior Sales Director

Baipas SRL Oradea, Romania
Mobil: +4 0747 854 850
Phone: +4 0359 800 484
Fax: +4 0359 800 484
cristina.pentea@bypass.ro
www.bypass.ro
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, November 26, 2020 4:55 PM

To: Cristina Pentea

Subject: Re: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1684424408924560111%7Cmsg-f%3A16844353760009... 1/5
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26/11/2020 Gmail - RE: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request
I am happy to send a quotation, is your full address:

Baipas SRL
Oradea
Romania

Thank you.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders
may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance
on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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26/11/2020 Gmail - RE: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request
On Thu, 26 Nov 2020 at 14:49, Cristina Pentea <cristina.pentea@bypass.ro> wrote:

Hi Kate,
Thank you for your reply!
Please send the quote first, and the pro-forma invoice after we send the order.

VAT: RO 18419770 Baipas SRL

Regards,

Cristina

Cristina Pentea

Senior Sales Director

Baipas SRL Oradea, Romania
Mobil: +4 0747 854 850
Phone: +4 0359 800 484
Fax: +4 0359 800 484
cristina.pentea@bypass.ro
www.bypass.ro

%555
precision toals

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, November 26, 2020 3:45 PM

To: cristina.pentea@bypass.ro; Levente Barkoczi

Subject: Re: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request

Good afternoon Cristina,

| need to create a new account for you in order to send you a proforma invoice, | just need your delivery and invoice
addresses and VAT number.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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26/11/2020 Gmail - RE: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will.
Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in
the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 26 Nov 2020 at 12:04, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Cristina Pentea <cristina.pentea@bypass.ro>

Date: Thu, 26 Nov 2020 at 12:02

Subject: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request

To: <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: <office@viamed.co.uk>, <office@bypass.ro>, <cosmina.duma@bypass.ro>, Levente Barkoczi
<Levente.Barkoczi@plexus.com>

Good day!
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26/11/2020 Gmail - RE: Bypass - RFQ Viamed Oxygen Monitor - urgent request

I have your contact from Levente Barkoczi from Plexus Romania who asked to help them with the purchase of the below
product. We are their approved suppliers, and due to the urgency they've asked for our help.

Please send me a quotation for:

Part: 0111237, MX300 - This includes a free of charge R-17MED oxygen sensor with each MX —

Quantity: 2pcs.
Please confirm unit price, availability / lead time and shipping costs to 410600 Oradea.

Thank you!

Best regards,

Cristina

Cristina Pentea

Senior Sales Director

Baipas SRL Oradea, Romania
Mobil: +4 0747 854 850
Phone: +4 0359 800 484

Fax: +4 0359 800 484
cristina.pentea@bypass.ro
www.bypass.ro
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