26/11/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Gemco Service Ltd - P/O 140363

M Gmail Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: Gemco Service Ltd - P/O 140363

Ryan Curzon <Ryan.Curzon@gemco.co.uk>
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Caroline Reece <Caroline.Reece@gemco.co.uk>

Hi Zoe,
Sorry, we want the Viamed R-22AVG. | assumed Pete had copied you into the reply, see below.
Kind Regards

Ryan Curzon

Stock Controller

Tel: 0345 872 2400

Email: Ryan.Curzon@gemco.co.uk
Web: www.gemco.co.uk
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$ Consider the environment. Do you really need to print this email?

All views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender, not Gemco Service Ltd or Gemco Equipment Ltd. The information in this e-mail may be confidential and privileged. If you are not the
immediately by telephoning 0345 8722400. You should not copy this e-mail or use it for any other purposes nor disclose its contents to any other person. Although this e-mail and any attachments are beli
other defect that might affect any other computer or IT system into which they are received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that they have antivirus protection. No responsibility i
Gemco Equipment Ltd for any loss or damage arising in any way from receipt or use thereof. Gemco Service Ltd. is a company registered in England and Wales with a company number of 3514486, it's re,
Business Park, Moderna Way, Mytholmroyd, Hebden Bridge, West Yorkshire HX7 5QQ. Gemco Equipment Ltd. is a company registered in England and Wales with a company number of 4666699, it's reg
Summerhouse Rd, Moulton Park, Northampton NN3 6BJ.

From: Pete Tunbridge <Pete.Tunbridge@gemco.co.uk>
Sent: 25 November 2020 4:54 PM

To: Ryan Curzon <Ryan.Curzon@gemco.co.uk>

Cc: Purchasing <purchasing@gemco.co.uk>

Subject: RE: Gemco Service Ltd - P/O 140363

Hi Ryan,
Viamed R-22AVG - it has a better tolerance. See attached file from March last year

Regards

Pete

Pete Tunbridge
Workshop Supervisor
Tel: 03458722400

Email: Pete.Tunbridge@gemco.co.uk

From: Ryan Curzon <Ryan.Curzon@gemco.co.uk>

Sent: 25 November 2020 4:38 PM

To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk; Pete Tunbridge <Pete.Tunbridge@gemco.co.uk>
Cc: Purchasing <purchasing@gemco.co.uk>

Subject: RE: Gemco Service Ltd - P/O 140363

Importance: High
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Hi Pete,

Can you confirm the below please, our ref 30080032?

Thanks

Ryan Curzon
Stock Controller
Tel: 0345 872 2400

Email: Ryan.Curzon@gemco.co.uk

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal

[Quoted text hidden]
Ryan.Curzon@gemco.co.uk>

Cc: Purchasing <purchasing@gemco.co.uk>
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Pete Tunbridge <IMCEAEX-
_O=THECLOUDSERVICE_OU=EXCHANGE+20ADMINISTRATIVE+20GROUP+20+28FYDIBOHF23SPDLT+29_CN=RECIPIENTS_CN=PETE+2ETUNBRIDGE+40GEMCO+2ECO+2EUK1
To: Dennis Tacyn <Dennis.Tacyn@gemco.co.uk>, Rowland Wakeling <Rowland.Wakeling@gemco.co.uk>

Cc: Mike Green <Mike.Green@gemco.co.uk>

Bcec:

Date: Wed, 20 Mar 2019 11:20:09 +0000

Subject: RE: 02 Cells

All were 11 mv

From: Dennis Tacyn

Sent: 20 March 2019 10:14
To: Rowland Wakeling

Cc: Pete Tunbridge; Mike Green
Subject: RE: 02 Cells

What was the voltages seen on the 02 cells Pete ?

| discussed with Opus yesterday.
They are going to extend the upper limit for me in some test software so we can try.

This should be a little more tolerant of variations.

Dennis

From: Rowland Wakeling

Sent: 20 March 2019 10:11

To: 'steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk'

Cc: Pete Tunbridge; Mike Green; Dennis Tacyn
Subject: RE: 02 Cells

Steve

We have now tested the 10 x R-22AVG and found them to have a better range for our application

We will take those for the 48 replacements and | will change the part number going forward do you want us to quote R-22AVG or 0110182 from your delivery note?

Also is the price any cheaper we still be ordering in 100 min and | thought from our conversation some time ago there was a possible reduction
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Steve Hardaker
Sent: 12 March 2019 09:42

To: Rowland Wakeling

Subject: Re: 02 Cells

Hi Rowland,

Please can you return them to me using returns authorisation ref SRS66967 and we will replace them for you.

Looking at that batch that you purchased in November, I can see from the QA data that there is a wide spread of outputs, most are mid-range but quite a number of sensors were edging to
which is within the QA limit of 13.0 mV but it appears that they have drifted high since QA This was one of our motivating factors when developing the Viamed R-22AVG; to keep that output
with a tighter spec and minimal drift.

I know that you have not yet received the 10-off R-22AVG that you ordered, they are due to land with us this week, so depending upon how you are doing for stock, there appears to be 3 o

1) if you need some now, we can replace these 48 with the same Teledyne R-22AV (I would request cherry-picked sensors with the lowest outputs if we go with this)

2) replace them with 48x R-22AV, expected end of week/early next week

3) put the replacements on hold until you have had a chance to get the 10x R-22AVG into service so that you can make an informed decision and replace them at a later date.

I do apologise for the inconvenience and will work to sort these out for you as smoothly as possible, please could you let me know your thoughts on how you would like to proceed?

Regards,

Steve

Steve Hardaker
Technical Support Manager
Viamed Ltd.

Website: www.viamed.co.uk

email: steve.hardaker@viamedco.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 1291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 12 Mar 2019 at 09:07, Rowland Wakeling <Rowland.Wakeling@gemco.co.uk> wrote:

Steve

We have now gone through our stock and we have 48 that are out of range for us to use, | would like to return them

Rowland Wakeling | Logistics Support Operative | Gemco Service Ltd
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E: Rowland.Wakeling@gemco.couk | T: 01606 542341 | M:

L |

All views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender, not Gemco Service Ltd. The information in this e-mail may be confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient please notify us immediately by telephoning 01422 888100. You shot
purposes nor disclose its contents to any other person. Although this e-mail and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus, or any other defect that might affect any other computer or IT system into which they are received and opened, it is the responsibili

antivirus protection. No responsibility is accepted by Gemco Service Ltd. for any loss or damage arising in any way from receipt or use thereof. Gemco Service Ltd. is a company registered in England and Wales with a company number of 3514486, it's registered office
Way, Mytholmroyd, Hebden Bridge, West Yorkshire HX7 5QQ.

D RE: O2 Cells.eml
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