26/11/2020 Gmail - Fwd: 0110238 R-22AT Oxygen Sensor

M Gma” Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Fwd: 0110238 R-22AT Oxygen Sensor

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 25 November 2020 at 17:19

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Gail, please put a proforma together for them.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Wed, 25 Nov 2020 at 16:22

Subject: Fwd: 0110238 R-22AT Oxygen Sensor

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Joey Ridge <divetechcyprus@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, 25 Nov 2020 at 16:21

Subject: 0110238 R-22AT Oxygen Sensor

To: info@vandagraphst.com <info@vandagraphst.com>

Hi Vandagraph,

My old company was jr easy divers.

| will not use my company’s vat, so you can charge me for this if needed.

Please put invoice for JT YACHT CAT SERVICES

Address: 315 Protara—Kavo Grecko Ave,
Protaras, 5296. Cyprus cy

Tel:+357 99676216

Please tell me how | can pay for this sensor.
Regards

Joey Ridge

Cyprus cy

Joey A.Ridge

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=154df70736&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1684353595064218511&simpl=msg-f%3A16843535950...
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