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Order 29102013RS Tracking RV920488701GB 
3 messages

Gail Bell <gail.bell@viamed.co.uk> 2 November 2020 at 09:25
To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl

Dear Jacek Zachara, 

I am writing to inform you that your order, 29102013RS has been dispatched. 

You can track your order reference 29102013RS on the , with the following tracking number RV920488701GB. 

Please see attached delivery note,  DAN126871-1 and a copy of your invoice, RAN126871-1. 

Kind Regards  

Gail Bell 
Vandagraph Ltd 
gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

2 attachments

RAN126871-1.pdf 
76K

DAN126871-1.pdf 
75K

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 November 2020 at 17:16
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> 
Date: Mon, 16 Nov 2020 at 17:15 
Subject: RE: Order 29102013RS Tracking RV920488701GB 
To: Gail Bell <office@viamed.co.uk> 

Hi Gail

I need few sensors

3 x R17VAN and 1 x R22VAN

Please take money from my Visa card for Invoice RAN126871-1 and current invoice

Best Regards Jacek
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Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 November 2020 at 17:19
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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