M Gmail

Fwd: MRI 02 monitor

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Daniel Anderson <Daniel.Anderson@healthshare.org.uk>
Date: Sat, 14 Nov 2020 at 07:51

Subject: RE: MRI 02 monitor

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Thanks Kate.

Global Clinic Norwich
Colney Hall

Watton Road
Norwich

NR47TY.
Invoice and delivery address.
I would like to order 2 please.

Thanks

Dan

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 26 October 2020 08:45

To: Daniel Anderson <Daniel. Anderson@Healthshare.org.uk>

Subject: Re: MRI 02 monitor

Good morning Daniel,

Thank you for your reply.

The oxygen sensor you need is the R-17MED, 0110017. The price breaks are as follows:

1=£42.00 each 2 =£ 38.00 each

Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors and all prices are excluding VAT.

3-10 = £ 36.00 each 11 or more = £ 34.00 each

Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Mon, Nov 16, 2020 at 8:01 AM

| don't think you have bought from us before, so please could | ask for your delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you and | can then issue you with

a proforma invoice.

We accept payment by bank transfer. At the moment we are working remotely so it's not as quick as usual for us to accept credit card payments, but we can do so if you need

us to.

Many thanks.


mailto:Daniel.Anderson@healthshare.org.uk
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Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone
calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best
we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 25 Oct 2020 at 10:42, Daniel Anderson <Daniel.Anderson@healthshare.org.uk> wrote:
Good Morning.
Model — MX300
Serial number — 335302
Thanks

Dan

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 25 October 2020 10:09

To: Daniel Anderson <Daniel.Anderson@Healthshare.org.uk>

Subject: Re: MRI 02 monitor

Good morning Daniel,

Thank you for your email.

Are you able to tell me which oxygen monitor you have, or perhaps the serial number? | can then ensure | reply with the correct information.

It will be tomorrow morning when | next reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 25 Oct 2020 at 10:04, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

--- Forwarded message --
From: Daniel Anderson <Daniel.Anderson@healthshare.org.uk>

Date: Sun, 25 Oct 2020 at 08:58

Subject: MRI 02 monitor

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>, enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Mark Terry <mark.terry@healthshare.org.uk>, Kirsty Clark <kirsty.clark@healthshare.org.uk>, Tapiwa Sithole <tapiwa.sithole@healthshare.org.uk>

Morning Viamed.

I've been given your contact details by Simon at Lamboo. We have a viamed oxygen monitor for our MRI scanner room but we need some replacement oxygen sensors as
| believe they only last for a period before needing replacing.

Would you be able to let us know if we are able to get hold of 4 of these and how much that would cost? If you are able to quote us for this | can sort out the payment as we
need these asap.

Thanks

Daniel Anderson

Lead MRI Radiographer
Global Clinic Norwich
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