
Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: `T` Adapter for use with 15mm O.D. flow diverters 
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Nov 3, 2020 at 2:59 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542 
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Alex Kit <a.kit@beer-co.com> 
Date: Tue, 3 Nov 2020 at 14:26 
Subject: RE: `T` Adapter for use with 15mm O.D. flow diverters 
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> 
Cc: <a.salenko@uksnab.beer-co.com> 

Now I understand you.

I thought that they were kept for too long and their cer�ficate has expired.

We will not use them for medical purposes. We are developing a ven�lator and we need them for calibra�ng.

Please - make us an invoice.

Alexey will be engaged in further support of the transac�on (he is in a copy)

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine 
Sent: Tuesday, November 3, 2020 3:55 PM 
To: Alex Kit 
Subject: Re: `T` Adapter for use with 15mm O.D. flow diverters

 

Dear Alex

 

I am not sure I understand your 1st question?

 

They are not certified, as the costs of meeting the latest CE certification are too high and are not supported by the current sales volume.

 

Are you wanting them for medical use? If so, will you require CE certification?

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Tue, 3 Nov 2020 at 13:52, Alex Kit <a.kit@beer-co.com> wrote:
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Do you mean specifically these details that you have? or all these details?

For what reason are they not cer�fied?

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine 
Sent: Tuesday, November 3, 2020 3:47 PM 
To: a.kit@beer-co.com 
Subject: Re: `T` Adapter for use with 15mm O.D. flow diverters

 

Dear Alex

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

These parts no longer have EU CE certification for medical use? If you do not require them for medical use or you do not require CE certification, then they are available to
purchase:

 

0120108 - T Adapter = USD $6.65 each EXW

 

We currently have 24 pieces available from stock.

 

I look forward to your feedback and I welcome any questions you may have.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Tue, 3 Nov 2020 at 11:48, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Alex Kit <a.kit@beer-co.com> 
Date: Tue, 3 Nov 2020 at 11:30 
Subject: `T` Adapter for use with 15mm O.D. flow diverters 
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

 

Good afternoon

We are BBB company

and we would like to purchase this product from you in the amount of 2pcs

https://www.viamed.co.uk/uk/?uid=&sessionid=&g=&i=2&page=productview&cat=353&subcat=414&productid=0120108

 

Could make an Invoice for our company?

details about our company:

PJSC "UKsnab"

vul.Zaliznychna, 31-C,

Dergachi, Kharkiv region,
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Ukraine, 62301

Code ARCEO: 30169718

TIN 301697101077

 

Alex Kit

Operation manager

+380503640206

http://www.beer-co.com/

 

http://www.beer-co.com/

