
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Order 14092086GB Tracking RV920488370GB 
1 message

Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> 29 October 2020 at 10:02
Reply-To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl
To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Gail

I need 3 x R 17VAN

You can take cash from my card for invoices Invoice RAN125964-2 and Invoice RAN126581-1

It will be 162 £

Best Regards

Jacek

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Gail Bell 
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2020 1:38 PM 
To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl 
Subject: Re: Order 14092086GB Tracking RV920488370GB

 

Good afternoon Jacek,

 

Thank you, your payment of £552.00 was successfully received.

Kind regards

 

Gail Bell

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/

Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk


 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject
line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 19 Oct 2020 at 12:25, Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> wrote:

Hi Gail

Ok was the limit

Please try again

Best Regards

Jacek

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Gail Bell 
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2020 12:44 PM 
To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl 
Subject: Re: Order 14092086GB Tracking RV920488370GB

 

Good morning Jacek

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

Apologies for the mix up.  I have tried your card details but its saying is not authorised.  Please would you check the details.

 

Kind regards

 

Gail Bell

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/

Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

mailto:jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
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http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it,
is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 15 Oct 2020 at 22:22, Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> wrote:

Hi Gail

I think you sent me the same twice.

It's about R 22VAN sensors.

I only ordered two but you sent me twice.

It's hard, but they've already been sent. J

I'll pay for them a li�le later with the R 17VAN sensors you sent me recently.

So now I will pay for the invoice RAN125853-2, RAN125964-1 and RAN125853-1

That together will be 552 £

Download money from my Visa GB

Best Regards

Jacek

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Gail Bell 
Sent: Thursday, October 15, 2020 11:41 AM 
To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl 
Subject: Re: Order 14092086GB Tracking RV920488370GB

 

Good morning Jacek,

 

Please find attached a statement of your account.  Total owing £633.00 GBP.

 

Kind regards

 

Gail Bell

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/

Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.
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E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on
it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 15 Oct 2020 at 08:47, Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

where do i find what he owes for the last deliveries please?  i have had a look but not sure i think he owes £568? but confused
if he pays by credit card as he goes along?

 

Kind regards

 

Gail Bell

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/

Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance
on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

-----------------

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Jacek Zachara <jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl> 
Date: Wed, 14 Oct 2020 at 19:43 

mailto:gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl


Subject: RE: Order 14092086GB Tracking RV920488370GB 
To: <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

 

Thanks Gail

How much money should I prepare on the card for the last deliveries ?

I also need 2 sensors R-17 VAN

Best Regards

Jacek

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Gail Bell 
Sent: Wednesday, October 14, 2020 9:36 AM 
To: jacekzachara@moana-sub.com.pl 
Subject: Order 14092086GB Tracking RV920488370GB

 

Dear Jacek Zachara, 
 
I am writing to inform you that your order, 14092086GB has been dispatched. 
 
You can track your order reference 14092086GB on the , with the following tracking number RV920488370GB. 

 
Please see attached delivery note,  DAN125964-2 and a copy of your invoice, RAN125964-2. 
 
Kind Regards  
 
 
Gail Bell 
Vandagraph Ltd 
gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

 

Wolny od wirusów. www.avg.com
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