M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Buying Sensors

1 message

Peter Crane <petercrane@scubatechdivers.com> 28 October 2020 at 08:50
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: viamedinbox@gmail.com, office@viamed.co.uk

Hi guys
| would like to make an order for Cyprus please.
Could | order

4 x R-33 DE
1xR-22 AEX

1 xR-33 VAN
We have been having a few issues recently with normal post, so | am wondering what is the cheapest you can send it by courier?

Thanks for your help

Peter

Scuba Tech Diving Centre

PO Box 37165

Protaras 5307

Cyprus

Tel: +357 99 184002

Web: www.scubatechdivers.com

Email: petercrane@scubatechdivers.com

Fird us on | S
Facebook EJ @ u


http://www.scubatechdivers.com/
mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
http://www.facebook.com/Scuba.Tech.Diving.Centre.Cyprus
http://pinterest.com/scubatech/boards
https://twitter.com/scubatechdivers

JEUEs/TEcH

The Number one Dive Centre for Diver Training in Cyprus.
Absolute Beginner to Technical Diving; TDI and PADI TecRec.
Megalodon Closed Circuit Rebreathers; Training and Diving

Dive the Zenobia Wreck in Cyprus.

The information in this email and in any attachments is confidential and intended solely for the attention and use of the named addressee(s). This information may be subject to
legal, professional or other privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, or a person responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you are not authorised to and must
not disclose, copy, distribute, or retain this message or any part of it. If you have received this message in error please contact the sender by email and delete all copies of the

message so that the appropriate action can be taken and avoid troubling you further

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 11 September 2019 13:43

To: peter crane

Subject: Re: Buying Sensors

Hi Peter
| can confirm your payment has arrived, thank you.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 10 Sep 2019 at 13:35, peter crane <petercrane@scubatechdivers.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan


mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com

Ok, | have just made a direct payment to the bank details on the invoice. You should receive it today with the reference Scuba Tech
Invoice 19722

Can you just confirm when you have received it.
Thanks
Regards

Peter Crane

Scuba Tech Diving Centre

PO Box 37165

Protaras 5307

Cyprus

Tel: +357 99 184002

Web: www.scubatechdivers.com

Email: petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
Firsd us om -
Facebook E'J @ u

Jeuen /TecH

The Number one Dive Centre for Diving in Cyprus.
Dive Training; Absolute Beginner to Technical and Megalodon Rebreather Diving.
Safari Dives: Dive the Zenobia Wreck, 6 other Local Wrecks and Lots of Shore Diving.

Dive Equipment: Servicing or Retail. Cyprus Dealers for Halcyon, Poseidon, Shearwater Research Ltd and Miflex Hoses

The information in this email and in any attachments is confidential and intended solely for the attention and use of the named addressee(s). This information
may be subject to legal, professional or other privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, or a person responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you
are not authorised to and must not disclose, copy, distribute, or retain this message or any part of it. If you have received this message in error please contact
the sender by email and delete all copies of the message so that the appropriate action can be taken and avoid troubling you further

From: Main Account On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 10 September 2019 15:01

To: peter crane <petercrane@scubatechdivers.com>
Subject: Re: Buying Sensors

Hi Peter


http://www.scubatechdivers.com/
mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
http://www.facebook.com/Scuba.Tech.Diving.Centre.Cyprus
http://pinterest.com/scubatech/boards
https://twitter.com/scubatechdivers
mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com

Please find your invoice attached.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 10 Sep 2019 at 12:59, peter crane <petercrane@scubatechdivers.com> wrote:

Thanks Ryan
Can you send me an invoice and | will get you paid for them
Regards

Peter Crane

Scuba Tech Diving Centre

PO Box 37165

Protaras 5307

Cyprus

Tel: +357 99 184002

Web: www.scubatechdivers.com

Email: petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
Fird us on =
Facebook E’ @ u

JEusn/TecH

The Number one Dive Centre for Diving in Cyprus.


http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
http://www.scubatechdivers.com/
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Dive Training; Absolute Beginner to Technical and Megalodon Rebreather Diving.
Safari Dives: Dive the Zenobia Wreck, 6 other Local Wrecks and Lots of Shore Diving.

Dive Equipment: Servicing or Retail. Cyprus Dealers for Halcyon, Poseidon, Shearwater Research Ltd and Miflex Hoses

The information in this email and in any attachments is confidential and intended solely for the attention and use of the named addressee(s). This information
may be subject to legal, professional or other privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, or a person responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient,
you are not authorised to and must not disclose, copy, distribute, or retain this message or any part of it. If you have received this message in error please
contact the sender by email and delete all copies of the message so that the appropriate action can be taken and avoid troubling you further

From: Main Account On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 10 September 2019 14:54

To: peter crane <petercrane@scubatechdivers.com>
Subject: Re: Buying Sensors

Hi Peter

| apologise, | was out of the office yesterday, but my colleague Gail has dispatched your order.

Thank you very much.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 10 Sep 2019 at 12:51, peter crane <petercrane@scubatechdivers.com> wrote:

Hi guys

| sent an email regarding buying sensors from you last Friday but haven’t had any reply yet. Did you receive my order?

If not, can | please have

1x R22 AT

1 xR33 DE

1xR22 SHO


mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com

I need them fairly urgently now, so if we can get this sorted as soon as possible, | will be very grateful 'z >

Regards

Peter Crane

Scuba Tech Diving Centre

PO Box 37165

Protaras 5307

Cyprus

Tel: +357 99 184002

Web: www.scubatechdivers.com

Email: petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
Firsdl us on =
Facebook EJ @ u

Jeuan/TecH

The Number one Dive Centre for Diving in Cyprus.
Dive Training; Absolute Beginner to Technical and Megalodon Rebreather Diving.
Safari Dives: Dive the Zenobia Wreck, 6 other Local Wrecks and Lots of Shore Diving.

Dive Equipment: Servicing or Retail. Cyprus Dealers for Halcyon, Poseidon, Shearwater Research Ltd and Miflex Hoses

The information in this email and in any attachments is confidential and intended solely for the attention and use of the named addressee(s). This
information may be subject to legal, professional or other privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, or a person responsible for delivering it to the
intended recipient, you are not authorised to and must not disclose, copy, distribute, or retain this message or any part of it. If you have received this
message in error please contact the sender by email and delete all copies of the message so that the appropriate action can be taken and avoid troubling
you further

From: peter crane

Sent: 06 September 2019 16:47

To: 'Jean Lamb' <jean.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>
Subject: RE: Buying Sensors

Hi Jean

Can we please order a few Oxygen Sensors from you.


http://www.scubatechdivers.com/
mailto:petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
http://www.facebook.com/Scuba.Tech.Diving.Centre.Cyprus
http://pinterest.com/scubatech/boards
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| need

1xR22 AT
1xR33 DE
1xR22 SHO

Thanks very much
Regards

Peter Crane

Scuba Tech Diving Centre

PO Box 37165

Protaras 5307

Cyprus

Tel: +357 99 184002

Web: www.scubatechdivers.com

Email: petercrane@scubatechdivers.com
Find us on -
Facebook LbJ @ u

JEusn /TecH

The Number one Dive Centre for Diving in Cyprus.
Dive Training; Absolute Beginner to Technical and Megalodon Rebreather Diving.
Safari Dives: Dive the Zenobia Wreck, 6 other Local Wrecks and Lots of Shore Diving.

Dive Equipment: Servicing or Retail. Cyprus Dealers for Halcyon, Poseidon, Shearwater Research Ltd and Miflex Hoses

The information in this email and in any attachments is confidential and intended solely for the attention and use of the named addressee(s). This
information may be subject to legal, professional or other privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, or a person responsible for delivering it to the
intended recipient, you are not authorised to and must not disclose, copy, distribute, or retain this message or any part of it. If you have received this
message in error please contact the sender by email and delete all copies of the message so that the appropriate action can be taken and avoid troubling
you further
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