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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Website question 
1 message

sigit trijananto <s_trijananto@yahoo.com> 28 October 2020 at 04:07
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate,
Thank you for proforma invoice.
Please change invoice address to :
PT.Medcalindo
Ruko De Kahfi, Jl.M.Kahfi II No.23E
Cipedak, Jakarta Selatan 12630

Regards. 
Sigit Trijananto  

Sent from my iPhone

On 27 Oct 2020, at 16.35, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 

Good morning Sigit,

Thank you for your prompt reply.

Please see attached proforma invoice as requested.  Please let me know if you require any changes to be
made.

The V1000 has a production time of approximately two weeks from date of payment.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be
answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can. 
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On Tue, 27 Oct 2020 at 09:13, sigit trijananto <s_trijananto@yahoo.com> wrote: 
Good morning Kate,
 
Shipping address as follows : 
 
ID. LOGISTICS PTE LTD
Office :
115 Airport Cargo Road
#06-12 , CAB C
Singapore 819466
Tel : +65 65468681
Fax : +65 65468635
Pic : Azhar / Rashid
Marking NK
 
Thank you
 
Sent from my iPhone
 

On 27 Oct 2020, at 15.57, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote: 
 

 
Good morning Sigit,
 
Thank you for your enquiry via our website.
 
I will be happy to send you a quotation or proforma invoice for 2 x Foetal Heart Simulator V-
1000, part number 141000 and 2 x Case Protector for V-1000, part number 1420001.
 
As you have not ordered since 2017, please could I check your delivery and invoice
addresses?
 
The address I have is as follows:
 
4PL Logistics PTE LTD 
Airline Road #02-22 
Cargo Agent Building E 
Singapore 
819834 
 
Many thanks. 
 
Kind regards
 
Kate Griffiths
 
Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the
main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but
we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can. 
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