27/10/2020 Gmail - Re: Up dated question

M Gma || Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Up dated question

1 message

Qst <kontakt@qst.se> 27 October 2020 at 14:05

To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Dear Sara

Yes all addresses is correct But | like to have 4 pcs R-17AV if possible ( | ordered 2 from beginning) apologies for my
change

Regards Risto

27 okt. 2020 kl. 14:41 skrev Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk>:

Dear Risto,

Please disregard my last email.

| have attached the correct proforma invoice for 10 x R-22AV and 2 x R-17AV sensors.
Please can you confirm that the invoice and delivery address is correct.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff
to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be
answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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Gmail - Re: Up dated question
On Tue, 27 Oct 2020 at 10:19, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Risto
No problem, my colleague Sarah will process your order.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 27 Oct 2020 at 08:21, Qst <kontakt@qst.se> wrote:

Hi

Sounds good can | have 10pcs? do you have some R-17AV ? | need only 4 by them

Regards Risto
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