
Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Re: Outstanding Invoice 
1 message

helen lamb <office@viamed.co.uk> 28 September 2018 at 14:44
Reply-To: helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk
To: Дмитрий Григорьев <spo2@inbox.ru>

 Dear Sir

Yes we require a valid VAT number form you. Otherwise we have to change you VAT. 

Kind regards
Helen Lamb  

On Fri, 28 Sep 2018, 2:06 pm Дмитрий Григорьев, <spo2@inbox.ru> wrote: 
I figured out the problem.  
This is an addition of VAT to the paid invoices . 
I will pay it  If it need for you 
 
But I don't understand the point of the problem. 
 What's side the question comming? 
 I'm paying from the EU. 
 I get the goods on the territory of the European Union.  
The transaction is made within the European Union. 
 ? the problem is --- I don't have a number in EU? correct? 
 
 

Вторник, 25 сентября 2018, 19:20 +03:00 от helen lamb <office@viamed.co.uk>: 
 
Outstanding Invoice
 
Dear Accounts
 
We have an outstanding invoice on our account for you, I have attached it for reference.
 
Please arrange payment as soon as possible.
 
Kind regards  
 
Helen Lamb  
Accounts Director  
Viamed Ltd  
 
http://www.viamed.co.uk  
Email: helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk 
Email: helen.lamb@viamed.me.uk  
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542  
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582  
 
Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up  
 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd  
Facebook: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK  
 
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.  
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E-mail Disclaimer  
-----------------  
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.  
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.  
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.  
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542 
 
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------  

 
 
С уважением! 
Григорьев Дмитрий 
+7 925 083 29 73 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy

