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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: Oxygen Sensor request 
1 message

Brahim Elallam <i.elallam@lemonmedical.com> 20 October 2020 at 15:36
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

 

We are two sister companies. Lemon Medical GmbH and Medical Equipment Europe.

So, for this quotation, please make it in the name of Medical Equipment Europe GmbH.

 

Cordially,

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen aus Hammelburg / With best regards from Hammelburg /

El Allam Brahim 

R&D Engineer

Lemon Medical GmbH

Telefon:    +49 (0) 9732 88987-15

Telefax:    +49 (0) 9732 88987-11

Dr.-Georg-Schäfer-Straße 14

D-97762 Hammelburg , Germany

 

 

 

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Kate Griffiths 
Gesendet: Tuesday, October 20, 2020 4:31 PM 
An: Brahim Elallam <i.elallam@lemonmedical.com> 
Cc: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Betreff: Re: Oxygen Sensor request

 

Good afternoon Brahim,

 

Thank you for your email.  I will be happy to send you a quotation or proforma invoice for items 0110080 and 0110081.

 

Am I correct that you are a separate company to Lemon Medical please?  

 

If so, I would need to set up a new account for you.  If you are a separate company, I would need your delivery and invoice
addresses.
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I await your reply.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take
longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on
it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, 20 Oct 2020 at 15:18, Brahim Elallam <i.elallam@lemonmedical.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,
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Thank you for your feedback.

Could you please send me the quotation for this sensor with his board?

 

Cordially,

Mit freundlichen Grüßen aus Hammelburg / With best regards from Hammelburg /

El Allam Brahim 

R&D Engineer

Lemon Medical GmbH

Telefon:    +49 (0) 9732 88987-15

Telefax:    +49 (0) 9732 88987-11

Dr.-Georg-Schäfer-Straße 14

D-97762 Hammelburg , Germany

 

 

 

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine 
Gesendet: Tuesday, October 20, 2020 4:04 PM
An: Brahim Elallam <i.elallam@lemonmedical.com> 
Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 
Betreff: Re: Oxygen Sensor request

 

Dear Brahim

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

We would be very happy to work with you on your new project, can I assume that you need breath by breath measurements? If
so, we can supply you with both the UFO sensor and the PCB that is required to run the ultra fast O2 sensors.

 

Please find some information attached.

 

If the UFO sensors look like they are going to be suitable for your requirements, then please let me know what you think your
requirements are likely to be and we can give you a quotation.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine 
International Sales Manager 
VIAMED 
www.viamed.co.uk 
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk 
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Brahim Elallam <i.elallam@lemonmedical.com> 
Date: Mon, 19 Oct 2020 at 11:36 
Subject: Oxygen Sensor request 
To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Manager, 
 
We are Medical Equipment Europe GmbH (Lemon Medical Sister Company), a company that produces and develops
products for lung-function, we sell our devices worldwide.  
At the moment we are working on a new project that requires fast response O2 Sensor, your products look very interesting
for us.  
Is there a way to get a sample for testing, and what are the general prices for this O2 Sensor?  
 
Thank you and Kind Regards.

Mit freundlichen Grüßen aus Hammelburg / With best regards from Hammelburg /

El Allam Brahim 

R&D Engineer

Lemon Medical GmbH

Telefon:    +49 (0) 9732 88987-15

Telefax:    +49 (0) 9732 88987-11

Dr.-Georg-Schäfer-Straße 14

D-97762 Hammelburg , Germany
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