16/10/2020 Gmail - Fwd: order 21-9-2020

M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: order 21-9-2020

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 15 October 2020 at 15:55
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <despina@ergogenic.gr>

Date: Thu, 15 Oct 2020 at 15:52
Subject: order 21-9-2020

To: Viamed Ltd <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Sarah,

The attached proforma invoice that we received for our order is in BP

Can | have one in Euro currency?

Furthermore,
According to the new price catalogue we received August 21 (see below) the R22MED costs €30

Can you please revise our proforma invoice accordingly?

Kind Regards,

Despina Papadopoulos

Ergogenic innovative Health Technology

Athinas 1-3, 141 21 Athens, Greece
Tel: (+30) 210 6147597-9 , mob: (+30)6946840965

Web sites: www.ergogenic.gr /// www.inbody.gr
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