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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Pro-forma invoice VPRO11080 dated 30.4.2019 
4 messages

Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk> 30 April 2019 at 10:59
Reply-To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
To: oxy@oxy.hr
Bcc: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good morning Sinisa Margetic, ing.

Thank you very much for your order.

Please find attached pro-forma invoice VPRO11080 dated 30.4.2019 for your approval.

Please check that all the details are correct including delivery address.

Our payment details are on the bottom of the invoice, alternatively you can call the office with card details.

Once payment is received your order will be shipped out to you.

Kind regards

Gail Bell
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900
-----------------
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58K

OXY d.o.o. <oxy@oxy.hr> 6 May 2019 at 10:55
To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Dear,

 

In the a�acment I send you a payment confirma�on.

 

Best regards,

 

Siniša Marge�ć

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
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Oxy d.o.o.

Kochova 3, 52100 Pula

Croatia

[Quoted text hidden]

Nalog_373112925.pdf 
31K

OXY d.o.o. <oxy@oxy.hr> 1 September 2020 at 11:21
To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Dear Gail,

 

Please send Your offer for:

 

1.       Oxygen Sensor R-22AT – 0110238 – 1 pcs.

2.       Oxygen Sensor R-33VAN (RP) – 0110239 – 1 pcs.

 

If you have in offer please also offer helium sensor for Analox ata pro (9100-4535)

 

Best regards,

 

Siniša Marge�ć,

 

Oxy d.o.o.

Kochova 3, 52100 Pula

Croatia

VAT nr: 71123646606

Email: oxy@oxy.hr
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Gail Bell 
Sent: Tuesday, April 30, 2019 11:59 AM 
To: oxy@oxy.hr 
Subject: Pro-forma invoice VPRO11080 dated 30.4.2019

 

Good morning Sinisa Margetic, ing.

[Quoted text hidden]

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 13 October 2020 at 17:51
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Please can you amend their proforma accordingly.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: OXY d.o.o. <oxy@oxy.hr> 
Date: Mon, 12 Oct 2020 at 10:46 
Subject: RE: Pro-forma invoice VPRO11080 dated 30.4.2019 
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> 

Dear Ryan,

 

sorry for not replying to email. Due to the long delivery �me, the buyer gave up on buying the R-22AT probe.

 

Please send proforma invoice for 2 pieces of R-33 VAN (RP) probe with shipping costs included.

 

Thank you.

 

With respect,

 

Best regards,

Siniša Marge�ć,

 Oxy d.o.o.

Kochova 3, 52100 Pula

Croatia
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VAT nr: 71123646606

Email: oxy@oxy.hr

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine 
Sent: Tuesday, September 1, 2020 5:09 PM 
To: OXY d.o.o. <oxy@oxy.hr> 
Subject: Re: Pro-forma invoice VPRO11080 dated 30.4.2019

 

Dear Sinsa

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

We are having some issues with stock at the moment, due to the pandemic. The production of sensors has been
prioritised towards medical requirements. 

 

We currently have stock of the R-33VAN(RP), but the R-22AT is likely to be the 1st week in October.

 

Unfortunately we do not supply the helium sensors for the ATA.

 

Please find a proforma invoice attached. I have added two lots of postage in case you wanted the R-33VAN(RP)
straight away and then the R-22AT when it becomes available. Please let me know if you would prefer to have the
sensors shipped together or cancel the R-22AT and I will amend the invoice accordingly.

 

I await your reply.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine 
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk 
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk 
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900 
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

[Quoted text hidden]
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