07/10/2020 Gmail - RE: Order of IRMA Airway Adapter Infant

M Gma“ Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: Order of IRMA Airway Adapter Infant

1 message
Peter Mendusi¢ <peter.mendusic@pulmodata.si> 7 October 2020 at 11:31

To: "sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sarah,

| will take one pack part number 4420511 IRMA airway Adapter Adult/Pediatric pack of 25 — the same as last time (in
July).

Please send them immediately. | hope the price is still the same as in July.

Kind regards,

Peter
Peter Mendusi¢

PULMODATA d.o.o.
Puchova 1

1235 Radomlje

Slovenia

Phone:+386 1 7239 511
Fax: +386 17239515
Mobil:+386 41 770 707

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: Wednesday, October 7, 2020 9:08 AM

To: Peter Mendusi¢ <peter.mendusic@pulmodata.si>

Subject: Re: Order of IRMA Airway Adapter Infant

Dear Peter,
Thank you for your email.

The IRMA airway Adapter Infant for use with Viamed VM-2500-M Mainstream and VM-2500-MG Multigas
Capnographs, pack of 10, part number 4420521 is $178.40 EXW. We do have these in stock.
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Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but

emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as
best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 7 Oct 2020 at 07:58, Peter Mendusi¢ <peter.mendusic@pulmodata.si> wrote:

Dear Sarah,
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In July | ordered 1 pack of IRMA Airway Adapter Adult/Pediatric (see attached Invoice) but this time | would need
IRMA Airway Adapter Infant.

Please be so kind and provide me part no. and price fort his product. | deeply hope the price is at least the same
and not higher than Adult/Pediatric.

Kind regards,

Peter

Peter Mendusi¢

PULMODATA d.o.o.
Puchova 1

1235 Radomlje
Slovenia

Phone:+386 1 7239 511
Fax: +386 17239515
Mobil:+386 41 770 707

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2020 3:58 PM

To: Peter Mendusi¢ <peter.mendusic@pulmodata.si>

Subject: Order 19082060SW Tracking 1Z29W96386869836034

Dear Peter,

| am writing to inform you that your order has been dispatched.

You can track your order on the UPS website, www.ups.com, with the following tracking number
1Z9W96386869836034.

Please see attached delivery note, DVM125545-1 and a copy of your invoice, RVM125545-1.

Kind Regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,

but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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