™M Gmail

Fwd: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

5 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>
Date: Tue, 29 Sep 2020 at 03:08

Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Craig Power <craig@roadbend.com.au>

Good Morning

| am trying to source 2 x R-22A O2 Sensors to be shipped to Western Australia.

Could you please email me price and availability on these.

Thank you & Regards
Lisa

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
=+61(08) 9362 1366

E accounts@roadbend.com.au

www.roadbend.com.au  Roadbend Jaguar ﬁ

?Roadbend Motors

JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Independent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Accounts@roadbend.com.au
Good afternoon Lisa,
Thank you for your enquiry.

The price for 2 x R-22A sensors is $55.00 each.

Due to the demand of Covid19 there is a lead time of approximately 4-6 weeks from the date of payment being received.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Tue, Sep 29, 2020 at 7:45 AM

Tue, Sep 29, 2020 at 1:34 PM
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Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to
the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>
Date: Tue, 29 Sep 2020 at 03:08

Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Craig Power <craig@roadbend.com.au>

Good Morning

| am trying to source 2 x R-22A O2 Sensors to be shipped to Western Australia.
Could you please email me price and availability on these.

Thank you & Regards

Lisa

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
&+61(08) 9362 1366

& accounts@roadbend.com.au

www.roadbend.com.au  Roadbend Jaguar n

4 Roadbend Motors

JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Independent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.

Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au> Wed, Sep 30, 2020 at 9:30 AM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Zoey


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
mailto:zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:Accounts@roadbend.com.au
mailto:enquiries@viamed.co.uk
mailto:enquiries@viamed.co.uk
mailto:craig@roadbend.com.au
mailto:accounts@roadbend.com.au
http://www.roadbend.com.au/
https://www.facebook.com/pages/Roadbend-Jaguar/141588749260434?fref=ts
http://www.facebook.com/pages/Roadbend-Jaguar/141588749260434?fref=ts

Can you please give me payment details or can | process this online
Also | will need shipping to Western Australia.

The $55 is obviously GBP?
Thank you
Lisa.

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
@&+61 (08) 9362 1366

E accounts@roadbend.com.au

www.roadbend.com.au  Roadbend Jaguar n

’Roadb end Motors

X ! ?f JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Independent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: Tuesday, 29 September 2020 8:34 PM

To: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>

Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

Good afternoon Lisa,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The price for 2 x R-22A sensors is $55.00 each.

Due to the demand of Covid19 there is a lead time of approximately 4-6 weeks from the date of payment being received.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now
working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to
continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>

Date: Tue, 29 Sep 2020 at 03:08

Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Craig Power <craig@roadbend.com.au>

Good Morning

| am trying to source 2 x R-22A 02 Sensors to be shipped to Western Australia.
Could you please email me price and availability on these.

Thank you & Regards

Lisa

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
@+61 (08) 9362 1366

E accounts@roadbend.com.au

www.roadbend.com.au  Roadbend Jaguar n

- Roadbend Motors

JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Inde ent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.
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Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Sep 30, 2020 at 9:45 AM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>

Hi Lisa,

Thank you for your reply.

If paying in GBP, the price would be £46.00 each.

Unfortunately orders can not be processed online. Please can you give me the full shipping address, invoice address and VAT number for me to set an account up for you
so | can send you a proforma invoice?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards
Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to
the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Sep 30, 2020 at 9:30 AM Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au> wrote:

Hi Zoey

Can you please give me payment details or can | process this online
Also | will need shipping to Western Australia.

The $55 is obviously GBP?

Thank you

Lisa.

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
=+61(08) 9362 1366

E accounts@roadbend.com.au

www.roadbend.com.au  Roadbend Jaguar n

Roadbend Motors

- E ?f JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Independent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"
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No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: Tuesday, 29 September 2020 8:34 PM

To: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>

Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

Good afternoon Lisa,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The price for 2 x R-22A sensors is $55.00 each.

Due to the demand of Covid19 there is a lead time of approximately 4-6 weeks from the date of payment being received.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now
working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim
to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

From: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>
Date: Tue, 29 Sep 2020 at 03:08
Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor
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To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Craig Power <craig@roadbend.com.au>

Good Morning

| am trying to source 2 x R-22A O2 Sensors to be shipped to Western Australia.
Could you please email me price and availability on these.

Thank you & Regards

Lisa

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
@&+61 (08) 9362 1366

E accounts@roadbend.com.au

www.roadbend.com.au  Roadbend Jaguar n

?Roadbend Motors

JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Independent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.

Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Zoey

Happy to pay in AUD if that is $55 just clarify for me.

Shipping and invoice address and details below:
Roadbend Motors

32 Welshpool Road

Welshpool

Western Australia

6106

Australia

We do not use VAT we do however use ABN: 29 096 859 037

If you would like to send through a pro form invoice | can pay on that or | can call and pay using a credit card.

Let me know what suits.

Thanks

Wed, Sep 30, 2020 at 10:06 AM
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Lisa.

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
&+61(08) 9362 1366

E accounts@roadbend.com.au
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’Roadb end Motors

VER
ndent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: Wednesday, 30 September 2020 4:46 PM

To: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>

Subject: Re: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

Hi Lisa,

Thank you for your reply.

If paying in GBP, the price would be £46.00 each.

Unfortunately orders can not be processed online. Please can you give me the full shipping address, invoice address and VAT number for me to set an account up for you
so | can send you a proforma invoice?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now
working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to
continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Sep 30, 2020 at 9:30 AM Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au> wrote:

Hi Zoey

Can you please give me payment details or can | process this online
Also | will need shipping to Western Australia.

The $55 is obviously GBP?
Thank you
Lisa.

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
=+61(08) 9362 1366

E accounts@roadbend.com.au

www.roadbend.com.au  Roadbend Jaguar n

- Roadbend Motors

JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Independent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion”

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: Tuesday, 29 September 2020 8:34 PM

To: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>

Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

Good afternoon Lisa,
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Thank you for your enquiry.

The price for 2 x R-22A sensors is $55.00 each.

Due to the demand of Covid19 there is a lead time of approximately 4-6 weeks from the date of payment being received.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now
working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim
to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

From: Lisa Percival <Accounts@roadbend.com.au>

Date: Tue, 29 Sep 2020 at 03:08

Subject: R-22A Oxygen Sensor

To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Craig Power <craig@roadbend.com.au>

Good Morning

| am trying to source 2 x R-22A O2 Sensors to be shipped to Western Australia.

Could you please email me price and availability on these.

Thank you & Regards
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Lisa

Lisa Percival

Accounts

Roadbend Motors
&+61 (08) 9362 1366

& accounts@roadbend.com.au
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JAGUAR LAND ROVER
Independent Specialist Est. 1965

32 Welshpool Road Welshpool 6106 Western Australia

"a Family business - a shared Passion"

No act of kindness, no matter how small, is ever wasted.
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