™M Gmail

Re: Buy sensor (question)
1 message

MpuHa HeBlyna <nevshupa2017@gmail.com>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Sales Invoice

Bill To: Irina Nevshupa
Geroev Dnepra 51
Apt. 88
Kiev
Ukraine 04214

Phone +380 95 544 53 63
Fax
E-mail nevshupa2017@gmail.com

Ship To:

Mobile
Fax

uT, 24 ceHT. 2020 1. B 17:59, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>:

Hi Irina
Please find the specifications attached.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Same

On Thu, 24 Sep 2020 at 15:31, NpuHa HeBwyna <nevshupa2017@gmail.com> wrote:

Could you give us the specifications of your medical sensor( Data Sheet)?

yT, 24 ceHT. 2020 1. B 14:23, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>:

Hi Irina

24 September 2020 at 17:27

They are both the same sensor with a different label, we supply the medical model, but | am currently awaiting stock. The
estimated time of arrival is the 3rd week of October. If you are okay to wait, then | would suggest placing your order so we

can add you to the queue.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 24 Sep 2020 at 11:42, UpuHa Heswyna <nevshupa2017@gmail.com> wrote:

Good. | will send all the data. | want to clarify which model you have. | need MAX-250 R125P01-003 or MAX-250

R125P01-002.
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https://shop.maxtec.com/product/scuba/scuba-sensors/max-250-scuba/

uT, 24 ceHT. 2020 1. B 12:22, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>:
Hi Irina

Thank you very much for your email.

You can use a credit or debit card on our website via paypal or if you would prefer to pay by bank transfer, please send
me your complete address and | will email you the information.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 24 Sep 2020 at 08:46, MpuHa HeBwyna <nevshupa2017@gmail.com> wrote:
https://www.vandagraph.co.uk/?uid=&sessionid=&page=quickbuy&cat=295&subcat=&productid=
0110425

Good afternoon. | need to buy a sensor from you (see link). | don't have PayPal. Can you give me invoice for
payment through the bank. Sincerely, Irina.
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