M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

R: quote for compatible 9100-9212-4 transducer

1 message

Donato De Marzo <d.demarzo@cnispa.it>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Ok, it is fine for a proforma invoice, which we can pay by credit card.

I ask the courtesy to issue an invoice with the following data:

Cni S.p.A.

S.P. Adelfia-Rutigliano - C.da Caggiano
70018 Rutigliano (BA) - Italy

VAT number: 02115331007

Fiscal Code: 80031450580

Recipient Code: BA6ET11

PEC: cnispa@postecert.it

Shipping is to be made to the same billing address.

I thank and cordially greet.

Da: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Per conto di Ryan Swaine
Inviato: martedi 22 settembre 2020 13:16

A: Donato De Marzo

Oggetto: Re: quote for compatible 9100-9212-4 transducer

Dear Donato

Thank you very much for your email.

I am happy to confirm that we can supply you with our R-33VAN-4 as a suitable replacement:

R-33VAN-4 = GBP £75
Postage = GBP £5
VAT (unless you have a VAT number) = GBP £16

Total = GBP 96

We will make the sensor to order, dispatch would be within a week of receipt of order.

23 September 2020 at 16:35


mailto:cnispa@postecert.it
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com

If you would like to proceed with an order, you can either place your order on our website or | can send you a proforma invoice,
which can be paid by bank transfer or credit card.

Please let me know if you have any questions.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 22 Sep 2020 at 08:49, Donato De Marzo <d.demarzo@cnispa.it> wrote:

Good morning, I have a 101D2 Analox oxygen analyzer and I need to replace the 9100-9212-4
transducer. I wanted to know if you have a compatible model and how much it costs including
shipping to Italy.

I thank and cordially greet.

Donato De Marzo

Sviluppo, Sistemi e Reti — Sede di Rutigliano

cni

BY TECH

CNI S.p.A.

Strada Provinciale Adelfia-Rutigliano, C.da Caggiano
Telefono + 39 080/4771357

Mobile + 39 348/8242638

Email: d.demarzo@cnispa.it

Web: www.cnispa.it

Ai sensi del regolamento 679/2016/UE (GDPR) sulla protezione dei dati, le informazioni contenute in questa e-mail sono
assolutamente riservate e confidenziali. Esse sono da considerarsi per uso esclusivo della persona o della Societa sopra
menzionata. Se il lettore del presente messaggio non & la persona cui esso € destinato o un responsabile della consegna,
esso & avvertito che qualsiasi divulgazione, distribuzione o copia del presente messaggio & assolutamente proibita.

Se questa comunicazione ¢ stata ricevuta per errore si prega di avvisare immediatamente il mittente.


http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:d.demarzo@cnispa.it
mailto:d.demarzo@cnispa.it
http://www.cnispa.it/




