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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order PO 20023
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 23 Septe
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Cristina <emedicmedicalgroup@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 23 Sep 2020 at 14:37
Subject: Re: Order PO 20023
To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,
Please, the shipping address is as follows:
EMEDIC MEDICAL GROUP (ALMACÉN SECURISTORE)
C/SAGRA, 12
03760 ALICANTE

Thank you

Cristina Izquierdo
Back Office manager
Nuevos teléfonos
administración y gestión: +34 966489195 || +34 675823151
comercial: +34 697706925

Libre de virus. www.avast.com

El mié., 23 sept. 2020 a las 12:35, EMG (<ptenorioemg@gmail.com>) escribió:
Dear Kate,
Good news!
Thank you
Best regards

Pedro Tenorio
EMG. Emedic Medical Group
+34 697 706 925            ptenorioemg@gmail.com

ᐧ

El mié., 23 sept. 2020 a las 12:03, Kate Griffiths (<office@viamed.co.uk>) escribió:
Good morning Pedro,

We aim to ship your goods later this week or early next week and will email you a tracking number when the goods leave our warehouse.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls 
office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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On Tue, 22 Sep 2020 at 08:42, EMG <ptenorioemg@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,
Please let us know when goods will be ready, approx.
Thank you and Regards.

Pedro Tenorio
EMG. Emedic Medical Group
+34 697 706 925            ptenorioemg@gmail.com

ᐧ

El mar., 22 sept. 2020 a las 9:31, Kate Griffiths (<office@viamed.co.uk>) escribió:
Good morning Pedro,

Thank you for your email.

Our accounts department has confirmed that they are happy for you to be a credit customer (30 days term) and I am happy to proceed with your order.
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Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone c
office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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On Mon, 21 Sep 2020 at 13:01, EMG <ptenorioemg@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate, 
Please check with Mr Ryan Swaine the payment condition we are working with.
Last March it happened in the same situation and Miss Cristina explained that we have an agreement of a 30 days payment invoice date, not advance payment. 
Again ask you to check our payment term in order not delay the delivery more than necessary and essential. 

Best regards
Pedro Tenorio
EMG. Emedic Medical Group
+34 697 706 925            ptenorioemg@gmail.com

Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> 13:38 (hace 11 minutos)
para mí

inglés español    Traducir mensajeDesactivar para: inglés

Hi Cristina,

Your order is not a confirmed order until we have received payment.  If you are able to pay before September 28th, I can then turn the proforma invoice into an order.  

Stock is not saved for you until payment is received.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone
main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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ᐧ
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