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1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 23 September 2020 at 12:14

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>

Date: Sun, 20 Sep 2020 at 12:24

Subject: RE: RFQ

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

Thank you for your support.

Please send me the invoice with shipping for R-23 sensors -5 pcs

Thankyou

Divya

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2020 4:39 PM

To: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ

Dear Divya

Although | can not guarantee that we have not quoted any other companies that may supply into Bahrain, we had an enquiry this
week that we refused to quote for R-23V sensors, as it looked like the same project that you are working on.

Best regards

Ryan
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On Tue, 25 Aug 2020 at 13:35, Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com> wrote:

Hi Team,

How are you all?

I just want to know, did any other companies from Bahrain ,contacted you for the quote on oxygen sensors R17, R23V ?
because these sensors are promoted from our company. If possible ,could you please let them know that we are promoting
these sensors in Bahrain. Because it will be a problem for us in future with same item, manufacturer, brand etc with
different prices. Since 2017 | am purchasing these from Viamed.

Thankyou

Divya

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, July 30, 2020 12:06 PM

To: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>

Cc: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: Re: RFQ

Dear Divya Sharma

Thank you for your enquiry and please accept my reply on Sarah's behalf.

The sensor you require is the MAX-250TM:

MAX-250TM - 0110435 = USD $84.25 each EXW

We currently have 19 available from stock, the balance would take approximately 4-6 weeks from receipt of order.

Please let me know if you would like to proceed with the order or if you have any questions.

Kind regards
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Hi Sarah,

Greetings from Naviga Medical,

We have an inquiry about the below mentioned item.

RESUSCITATOR ADULT MODEL
840 TYCO HEALTH CARE

No ITEM CODE DESCRIPTION QTY PART NO.
SENSOR OXYGEN CAT NO
- "y F.
1 22354-PN-03057 10097559 VENTILATOR 40-PCS 10097559

NOTHING FOLLOWS

Could you pleases send me the lowest quote to kingdom of Bahrain, if it comes in your product range.

Also send us the stock availability and shortest possible delivery time.

Waiting for your reply.

Regards,

Divya Sharma

Product Specialist

Mob  : +973 - 33629448

Wats up: +973 -38115436

Tel: 1 +973 - 17112344

Fax: 1 +973 - 17583324

Email: :divya@navigamedical.com

Web:  :www.navigamedical.com
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