
18/09/2020 Gmail - FW: FW: Purchase order 33462263
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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

FW: FW: Purchase order 33462263
1 message

NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk>
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "Deborah Williams (Aneurin Bevan UHB - Maternity)" <Deborah.Williams6@wales.nhs.uk>

Hi

Please see below confirma�on from end user

 

Many thanks, Stay Safe

 

 

Kind Regards

Del

 

Ms Delyth Jones

Swyddoges Categori - Clinigol

Category Officer - Clinical

Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIG Cymru – Gwasanaethau Caffael

NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership – Procurement Serices

 

 

Ffon Tel: 01745 366823

E-bost E-mail: delyth.jones4@wales.nhs.uk

Rhyngrwyd Internet: www.nwssp.wales.nhs.uk

Mewnryd Intranet: nww.nwssp.wales.nhs.uk

Twitter: @NWSSP

 

Alder House

Alder Court

St Asaph Business Park

Denbighshire

LL17 0JL

 

 

Rwy’n rhugl yn y Gymraeg as mae Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIH Cymru in croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg a Saesneg.  Im fluent in Wlesh and NHS Wales 

 

 

 

From: Deborah Williams (Aneurin Bevan UHB - Maternity) <Deborah.Williams6@wales.nhs.uk> 
Sent: 19 August 2020 16:30
To: NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk>
Subject: Re: FW: Purchase order 33462263

 

yes please!! Sorry for the delay

From: NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk>
Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2020 9:33 AM
To: Deborah Williams (Aneurin Bevan UHB - Maternity) <Deborah.Williams6@wales.nhs.uk>
Cc: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: FW: FW: Purchase order 33462263
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Hi

 

Please see below message received from Viamed re purchase order number 33462263 – can you please let Zoey know whether ok to proceed with the carriage so order can be re

 

Many thanks, Stay Safe

 

 

Kind Regards

Del

 

Ms Delyth Jones

Swyddoges Categori - Clinigol

Category Officer - Clinical

Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIG Cymru – Gwasanaethau Caffael

NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership – Procurement Serices

 

 

Ffon Tel: 01745 366823

E-bost E-mail: delyth.jones4@wales.nhs.uk

Rhyngrwyd Internet: www.nwssp.wales.nhs.uk

Mewnryd Intranet: nww.nwssp.wales.nhs.uk

Twitter: @NWSSP

 

Alder House

Alder Court

St Asaph Business Park

Denbighshire

LL17 0JL

 

 

Rwy’n rhugl yn y Gymraeg as mae Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIH Cymru in croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg a Saesneg.  Im fluent in Wlesh and NHS Wales 

 

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: 18 August 2020 14:46
To: NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk>
Subject: Re: FW: Purchase order 33462263

 

Good afternoon, 

 

I am just following up on my previous email. 

Please can you confirm if you are happy to proceed?

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal
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Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main off

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, Jul 30, 2020 at 1:19 PM NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk> wrote:

Hi

 

Please see below message received from Viamed re purchase order number 33462263  - can you please add the carriage line to the order and let Zoey know once done so orde
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Please note – the carriage details is noted in the long descrip�on (details as below screen shot) and must be added to every order
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Many thanks, Stay Safe

 

Kind Regards

Del

 

Ms Delyth Jones

Swyddoges Categori - Clinigol

Category Officer - Clinical

Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIG Cymru – Gwasanaethau Caffael

NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership – Procurement Serices

 

 

Ffon Tel: 01745 366823

E-bost E-mail: delyth.jones4@wales.nhs.uk

Rhyngrwyd Internet: www.nwssp.wales.nhs.uk

Mewnryd Intranet: nww.nwssp.wales.nhs.uk

Twitter: @NWSSP
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Alder House

Alder Court

St Asaph Business Park

Denbighshire

LL17 0JL

 

 

Rwy’n rhugl yn y Gymraeg as mae Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIH Cymru in croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg a Saesneg.  Im fluent in Wlesh and NHS Wal

 

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: 30 July 2020 09:22
To: NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk>
Subject: Re: Purchase order 33455088

 

Good morning, 

 

I am just following up on my previous email. 

Please can you confirm if we can proceed with the carriage charge of £5.00 so we can release this order?

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

 

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main 
can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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On Thu, Jun 25, 2020 at 1:30 PM Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon, 

 

Thank you for your order. 

 

I am writing to advise you that there is a carriage of £5.00 required for this order. 

 

Please can you confirm if you are happy to accept?

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

 

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the ma
can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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