l I Gmall Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: R-17 Med sensor

7 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 1:20 PM
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jennifer Ducker <jennifer@oxygen.org.je>
Date: Wed, 16 Sep 2020 at 13:19

Subject: R-17 Med sensor

To: Info <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,
| would like to place an order for two of the above sensors please, their part number is 0110017.

| look forward to hearing from you in due course,

Many thanks,
Jennifer

centre address is as follows-
Oxygen Therapy Centre,
Philip James House,

Oak Tree Gardens,

Trinity Hill,

St Helier

Jersey

JE2 47U

Jennifer Ducker f L 4
Chair of Trustees

. 01534 737297 s OXYGEN

@ OXygen_OI’g_je THERAPY CENTRE

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 1:41 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Jennifer <jennifer@oxygen.org.je>

Good afternoon Jennifer,

Thank you for your email.

Do you have a purchase order number that you would like me to use?
If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to
the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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Jennifer Ducker <jennifer@oxygen.org.je> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 1:45 PM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
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Hi Zoey,

No | do not have a purchase number for you to use. How much will the sensors be and how would you like us to pay please?
| can either send a cheque, pay by card or bank transfer.

Many thanks,
Jennifer

Jennifer Ducker f L 4
Chair of Trustees
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Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 1:55 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Jennifer Ducker <jennifer@oxygen.org.je>

Hello Jennifer,

The price for two x R-17MED is £38.00 each.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to
the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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Jennifer Ducker <jennifer@oxygen.org.je> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 1:57 PM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Hi Zoey,
How would you like me to pay for the sensors?

Thanks,
Jennifer

Jennifer Ducker f L 4
Chair of Trustees
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Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 2:07 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Jennifer Ducker <jennifer@oxygen.org.je>

Hi Jennifer,

You are on a 30 day account so you can pay once you receive the invoice.
Would you like me to go ahead with your order?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to
the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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Jennifer Ducker <jennifer@oxygen.org.je> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 2:40 PM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Hi Zoey,
Yes please can you place the order.

Many thanks,
Jennifer

Jennifer Ducker f L 4
Chair of Trustees
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