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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen sensors
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 September 2020 at 11:21
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Wed, 16 Sep 2020 at 10:51
Subject: Fwd: Oxygen sensors
To: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

Please send pro-forma to Darren Legh at Lear Corporation.

dlegh@lear.com

Tel. 07787 222900

He wants to pay for the following by credit card.

1 x  4330122 @ £32.00 + VAT
PPUPS £10.00

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Thu, 20 Aug 2020 at 17:30
Subject: Re: Oxygen sensors
To: Freeman Lea, Adam <AFreemanLea@lear.com>

OK, but we will have to transfer to single plain anti-static bags.

Cost £32.00 each

Steve

On Thu, 20 Aug 2020 at 17:22, Freeman Lea, Adam <AFreemanLea@lear.com> wrote:

Thanks for the quick response?

 

Is there any chance we can order just a few sample parts rather than the MOQ of 30? £840 + VAT is going to be
very difficult if we only require 1 for the prototype?

 

Thanks for your help!

 

Regards,
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