l I Gmall Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: QUOTATION TACOM

2 messages

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Sep 14, 2020 at 12:20 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br>
Date: Thu, 10 Sep 2020 at 13:37

Subject: RES: QUOTATION TACOM

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Julice Cruz <julice.cruz@tacom.com.br>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, Thamiris Ferreira
<thamiris@tacom.com.br>

Ryan,
Please send me link to pay by paypal.
We have DHL or fedex account, so freight value we will pay.

Thanks,

2 TACOM 95

Vania Cristina

Coordenagéo de Compras e Importagéo

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1028
Belo Horizonte - MG cristina@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Em nome de Ryan Swaine

Enviada em: quinta-feira, 10 de setembro de 2020 05:46

Para: Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br>

Cc: Julice Cruz <julice.cruz@tacom.com.br>; Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>; Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>; Thamiris Ferreira
<thamiris@tacom.com.br>

Assunto: Re: QUOTATION TACOM

Dear Vania & Julice

| apologise for my late reply.

| can confirm that we have 10 pieces of 0131202 cables available from stock.

Best regards
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Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 9 Sep 2020 at 19:36, Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br> wrote:

The part number is 0131202

Vania Cristina

Coordenacdo de Compras e Importagdo

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1028

Belo Horizonte - MG cristina@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br

De: Vania Cristina [mailto:cristina@tacom.com.br]

Enviada em: quarta-feira, 9 de setembro de 2020 15:36

Para: 'Julice Cruz' <julice.cruz@tacom.com.br>; 'sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk' <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>; 'ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk'
<ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>; 'viamedinbox@gmail.com' <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: 'Thamiris Ferreira' (thamiris@tacom.com.br) <thamiris@tacom.com.br>

Assunto: RES: QUOTATION TACOM

Re-send

Y2 TACOM ¢,

Vania Cristina

Coordenagdo de Compras e Importagéo

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1028

Belo Horizonte - MG cristina@tacom.com.br
www.tacom.com.br

De: Julice Cruz [mailto:julice.cruz@tacom.com.br]
Enviada em: quarta-feira, 9 de setembro de 2020 15:29
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Para: cristina@tacom.com.br
Assunto: ENC: QUOTATION TACOM

Y2 TACOM ¢ 5,

Julice Alves

Assistente de Compras

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1032

Belo Horizonte - MG julice.cruz@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br

De: Julice Cruz [mailto:julice.cruz@tacom.com.br]

Enviada em: terga-feira, 8 de setembro de 2020 15:04

Para: 'ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk'
Assunto: QUOTATION TACOM

Hello Ryan ,

Do you have 10 units of OXYGEN SENSOR 3 METER HELICAL CABLE WITH 90 DEGREES CONNECTOR?

Please send me the price .

Awaiting your return .

Julice Alves

Assistente de Compras

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1032

Belo Horizonte - MG julice.cruz@tacom.com.br
www.tacom.com.br

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

From: Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Mon, 14 Sep 2020 at 12:22
Subject: Re: QUOTATION TACOM

Mon, Sep 14, 2020 at 12:22 PM
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To: Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br>

Cc: Julice Cruz <julice.cruz@tacom.com.br>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, Thamiris Ferreira
<thamiris@tacom.com.br>

Dear Vania

| apologise for the delay, my colleague Zoey will send you a proforma invoice today.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 11 Sep 2020 at 19:34, Vania Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br> wrote:

Re-send

%2 TACOM ¢ 3¢,

Vania Cristina

Coordenagao de Compras e Importagdo

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800 +55 (31) 3348 1028
Belo Horizonte - MG cristina@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br

[Quoted text hidden]
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