10/09/2020 Gmail - Re: Offer Request

M Gma“ Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Offer Request

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 10 September 2020 at 11:42
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Sarl Hospimedica Sarlhospimedica <sarlhospimedica@yahoo.fr>

Cc: "sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sabah
We can add your NIF number, my colleague Sarah can take care of this for you.

Unfortunately the country of origin has to be the USA and we are unable to change the HS code to the one you
mentioned, as | do not think it is appropriate?

With regards to payment, we require pre-payment by proforma invoice.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 10 Sep 2020 at 09:25, Sarl Hospimedica Sarlhospimedica <sarlhospimedica@yahoo.fr> wrote:
Kind Reminder!

M. NEKMOUCHE Mahiddine - Gérant
SARL HOSPIMEDICA
Cité des Annassers 2 Bt 17 N°2
Kouba Alger (Coopémad Nord)
Tél. 0021323703573
Fax : 0021323703568
Mobile: 00 213 550 92 92 72
00 213 560 41 05 52

Le mercredi 9 septembre 2020 a 16:26:57 UTC+2, Sarl Hospimedica Sarlhospimedica
<sarlhospimedica@yahoo.fr> a écrit :

Kind Reminder!

M. NEKMOUCHE Mahiddine - Gérant
SARL HOSPIMEDICA

Cité des Annassers 2 Bt 17 N°2

Kouba Alger (Coopémad Nord)
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Tel. 0021323703573

Fax : 002132370 3568

Mobile: 00 213 550 92 92 72
00 213 560 41 05 52

Le jeudi 3 septembre 2020 a 10:40:49 UTC+2, Sarl Hospimedica Sarlhospimedica <sarlhospimedica@yahoo.fr> a
écrit :

Dear Sarah,
Thank you for the proforma.
Can you add on the proforma :

- NIF number :000716097807074

- Airport of origin : Keighley West Yorkshir UK

-HS code :6307909100

-payment agreement: 59 days from BL (if it's arrange you)

Best Regards.

Sabah

M. NEKMOUCHE Mahiddine - Gérant
SARL HOSPIMEDICA
Cité des Annassers 2 Bt 17 N°2
Kouba Alger (Coopémad Nord)
Tél. 0021323703573
Fax : 0021323703568
Mobile: 00213 550 92 92 72
00 213 560 41 05 52

Le mercredi 2 septembre 2020 a 13:59:50 UTC+2, Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :

Good afternoon,
Please find attached a proforma invoice for the EyeMax.
Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
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