™M Gmail

Fwd: Oxygen Sensors - VIAMED

2 messages

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Fabiano Milani - Santa Clara <milani@bold.net>
Date: Thu, 10 Sep 2020 at 02:57

Subject: Oxygen Sensors - VIAMED

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Thu, Sep 10, 2020 at 10:24 AM

Could you send us a proforma for 10 units of R-22MED? We will need to test them in our equipment prior to buy more units. We need to cheeck if everything will work

perfectly.

Please find below our data:

Corporate Name:

Bold Participagdes S/A

Joao Pessoa

Trading Name: Bold
|Address: Manoel Francisco da Costa street, N° 4500
Neighborhood

ZIP Code 89.257-407
City: Jaragua do Sul
State: Santa Catarina
VAT Number/TAX ID|

04.626.152/0001-55

Phone Number:

+055 47 3274-6500

If we need more sensors, what is the delivery time in casse you don't have in stock?

Are you a producer ou a distributor for this kind of sensors?

Thanks,

Fabiano Milani
Gerente Comercial - Aquisigbes
Fone: +55 (47) 3274-6523

Http://www.bold.net
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine
Enviada em: sexta-feira, 4 de setembro de 2020 10:22

Para: milani@bold.net

Assunto: Re: Oxygen Sensors - VIAMED

Dear Fabiano Milani

Thank you very much for your email.

Due to the pandemic, oxygen sensor production has been prioritised on the supply of the R-22MED sensor for use in the ventilator projects.

| am pleased to inform you that we currently have enough stock of the R-22MED to supply you with the 400x sensors you require. We would endeavour to dispatch them
as soon as payment is received against proforma invoice.

Please find the part number and pricing information below:

R-22MED - 01110022 = USD $32.50 each EXW

If you would like a formal quotation/proforma invoice with shipping costs, please provide me with your complete delivery and invoice details.

| look forward to your response and | welcome any questions you may have.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 3 Sep 2020 at 08:03, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Fabiano Milani - Santa Clara <milani@bold.net>
Date: Thu, 3 Sep 2020 at 02:51

Subject: Oxygen Sensors - VIAMED

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear All,

We are a company based in South of Brazil Please see more information in our website: https:/bold.net/en/.

I saw in your website that you produce oxygen sensors. We are interested in the models:
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R-22Vi Oxygen Sensor
R-22MEDV Oxygen Sensor
R-22MED Oxygen Sensor
R-22VA Oxygen Sensor

ITG MLF-16 Lead-free Oxygen Sensor

Envitec OOMLF102 Lead-free Oxygen Sensor

Could you send me a quotation?

Do you keep this sensors in stock? How many pieces can you ship?

If we need 400 sensors, what is the best delivery time?

Best regards,

Fabiano Milani
Business Manager - Acquisitions
Phone: +55 (47) 3274-6523

Http://www.bold.net

“BOLD

the world inspire us

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Fabiano Milani - Santa Clara <milani@bold.net>

Cc: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Dear Fabiano

Thank you for your email.

My colleague Zoey will be in contact with your proforma invoice.

Thu, Sep 10, 2020 at 10:43 AM

Our stock levels are changing constantly, but we are receiving regular shipments of the R-22MED sensors, delivery times will vary depending on your requirements. If you
can let me know the quantity you will require and when you are likely to need them for, | can give you a more precise answer? You originally mentioned 400, | can confirm

that we can currently supply this quantity within a few days of receipt of payment.
To clarify, we are the master distributor on behalf of Teledyne who are the manufacturer.

| look forward to your response and please let me know if you have any further questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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