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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Request For Price - 100x Oxygen Sensor- EA/COM/0820/7628 - ex UK to TR
1 message

Farshad <farshad@euroasia.biz.tr> 8 September 2020 at 12:54
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Cc: sales@euroasia.biz.tr

 

 

Dear Kate,

 

Thanks for your offer.

 

Please make Proforma Invoice to the below company;

 

SAB KİMYA SANAYİ VE TİCARET LTD. ŞTİ.
Mecidiyeköy Mah. Mecidiyeköy Yolu Cad.

No:10 Kat:13/52 Mecidiyeköy/Şişli, Istanbul, TURKIYE
Tel: 0212 213 00 07

 

Thank you.

 

Best regards

Farshad Nourfardi – CEO

***********************************************

EURO	ASIA	DIŞ	TICARET	LTD	ŞTI

Gulbahar	Mah.	Otello	Kamil	Sok.

Mert	Apt.	8/B	Gayrettepe

34394	Istanbul	TURKIYE

Tel.:	+90	212	777	72	22

Fax:	+90	212	777	72	21

   

 

tel:0212%20213%2000%2007
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Tuesday, September 1, 2020 2:18 PM
To: Farshad
Subject: Re: Request For Price - 100x Oxygen Sensor- EA/COM/0820/7628 - ex UK to TR

 

Good morning Farshad,

 

Thank you for your email.  We are all well, I hope you are too.

 

Am I right that you would like the price of 100 x 0110122, R-22A sensor as per a previous order?

 

If so, the price is $23.20 each when purchasing 100.

 

The lead time may be as long as at least October as there has been a shortage of automotive sensors being
produced as priority has been given to medical sensors due to the pandemic.

 

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges etc.

 

Many thanks. Kind regards

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails
will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we
can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 31 Aug 2020 at 14:28, Farshad <farshad@euroasia.biz.tr> wrote:

 

Hello Kate,

 

All goes well in these hard days? Hope you are fine and healthy…

 

Please let us have your goo fresh price for the same cargo nature, 100x units.

 

Thank you.

 

 

Best regards

Farshad Nourfardi – CEO

***********************************************

EURO	ASIA	DIŞ	TICARET	LTD	ŞTI

Gulbahar	Mah.	Otello	Kamil	Sok.

Mert	Apt.	8/B	Gayrettepe

34394	Istanbul	TURKIYE

Tel.:	+90	212	777	72	22

Fax:	+90	212	777	72	21

   

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, September 2, 2019 4:58 PM
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To: Farshad
Subject: Fwd: Order Confirma�on - 100x Oxygen Sensor- EA/COM/0819/6990 - ex UK to TR

 

Good afternoon Farshad,

 

Please see below for the email I sent to you (as requested) on August 29th (last Thursday).

 

As I mentioned in that email, please disregard proforma invoice PRO05661.

 

The new proforma is attached again.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
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